CITY @>E
WEST CHICAGO

WHERE HISTORY & PROGRESS MEET

NOTICE
PUBLIC AFFAIRS COMMITTEE

Monday, August 21, 2023
6:15 P.M. — Council Chambers

AGENDA

Call to Order, Roll Call, and Establishment of a Quorum

Approval of Minutes

A. Public Affairs Committee of July 20, 2023

Public Participation / Presentations

A. Draft Community Park Plan — Presentation by Consultant

Items for Consent

A. CF Cycle for Life Permit

B. Ordinance 23-0-0029 — An Ordinance Modifying Chapter 4, Article 1,
Building Code, of The Code of Ordinances of The City of West
Chicago

Items for Discussion

Unfinished Business

New Business

Reports from Staff

A. West Chicago Police Department Monthly Reports
B. Railroad Days Final Report

Adjournment

475 Main Street | T(630) 293-2200 Ruben Pineda
West Chicago, 1llinois | F(630) 293-3028 HavoR

| W wectehi . Nancy M. Smith Michael L. Guttman
60185 | www.mwestchicago.org CITY CLERK CITY ADMINISTRATOR



MINUTES
PUBLIC AFFAIRS COMMITTEE
Thursday, July 20,2023 7:00 P.M.
Call to Order, Roll Call, and Establishment of a Quorum.

Chairman Chassee called the meeting to order at 7:00pm. Roll Call found Alderman
Brown, Birch Ferguson, Smith and Short.

Alderman Hallett was not in attendance.

Moving Regularly Monthly Meeting Day and Time — Alderman Birch Ferguson
made a motion, seconded by Alderman Smith to move the Public Affairs Meeting to
the third Monday of the month at 6:15pm. Voting Aye: Chairman Chassee, Alderman
Birch Ferguson, Smith and Short. Voting Nay: 0. Abstain: 1. Motion carried.

Approval of Minutes.

A. Public Affairs Committee Minutes of May 22, 2023. Alderman Smith made a
motion, seconded by Alderman Brown to approve the revised minutes of the Public
Affairs Committee meeting. Voting Aye: Chairman Chassee, Alderman Brown, Birch
Ferguson, Smith and Short. Voting Nay: 0. Abstain: 0. Motion carried.

Public Participation / Presentations.

A. Marketing and Communication Strategic Plan — Daniel Peck, Marketing and
Communications Coordinator.

Items for Consent.

A. Marketing and Communication Strategic Plan - Alderman Birch Ferguson made
a motion, seconded by Alderman Smith to direct this item to City Council for approval.
Voting Aye: Chairman Chassee, Alderman Brown, Birch Ferguson, Smith and Short.
Voting Nay: 0. Motion carried.

B. Resolution 23-R-0062 — Intergovernmental Agreement with the West Chicago
Fire District for Certain Code Enforcement Matters - Alderman Birch Ferguson made a
motion, seconded by Alderman Smith to direct this item to City Council for approval.
Voting Aye: Chairman Chassee, Alderman Brown, Birch Ferguson, Smith and Short.
Voting Nay: 0. Motion carried.

Items for Discussion — Alderman Short addressed a concern on children riding their
scooter or mini bikes after dark. Chief Fleury will ask Community Relations Officer
Arms to post information on the use of them on the Facebook page.



7. Unfinished Business.
8. New Business.
9. Reports from Staff.
Chief Fleury gave an update on ongoing and past cases.
10.  Adjournment. Alderman Birch Ferguson made a motion to adjourn, seconded by

Alderman Smith. The motion approved by voice vote, and the meeting adjourned at
approximately 7:32pm.

Respectfully submitted,
Yahairow Bautistos

Administrative Assistant to Chief of Police
West Chicago Police Department



CITY OF WEST CHICAGO

PUBLIC AFFAIRS COMMITTEE
AGENDA ITEM SUMMARY
ITEM TITLE:
AGENDA ITEM NUMBER: 3 A.
Draft Community Park Plan — Former Kerr-McGee Site
FILE NUMBER:

COMMITTEE AGENDA DATE: August 21,
2023

COUNCIL AGENDA DATE:

STAFF REVIEW: Tom Dabareiner, AICP SIGNATURE %%/”

APPROVED BY CITY ADMINISTRATOR: Michael SIGNATURE
Guttman

At the January 23, 2023 meeting of the Public Affairs Committee, Upland Design Ltd., the consultant
contracted by the City for park planning services for the former Kerr-McGee site, presented a Draft
Community Plan for the future park site on the property. Following the discussion of the draft Plan,
members of the Committee directed Upland to prepare a phasing plan for the development of the
park and include the anticipated cost of construction associated with each phase. Members also re-
quested additional information for the proposed playground area and sensory garden with respect to
ADA amenities.

Upland has prepared this information and will present it at the August 21, 2023 meeting of the Public
Affairs Committee.

ACTIONS PROPOSED:

Following the presentation by Upland Design, Ltd. the Committee should discuss and make a rec-
ommendation to the City Council for adoption of the Community Park Plan.

COMMITTEE RECOMMENDATION:

Attachments: Draft Community Park Plan
Summary Cost of Construction Phases
Community Park Plan Enlargement
Playground Enlargement



{

%
b

Lan_ap PRPSET 3

) 3
SIMLL ot

pmatd Gedh A

Trail Head Entry Sculpt

Picnic Grove Shelter
- 20" Octagon Shelter
- Picnic Tables
- Concrete Paving
T PPN v

Connection to Existing Parking Lot

Pioneer Park Connection at Existing
Underpass

Proposed Monitoring Building Location
Current Monitoring Building Location
Existing Monitoring Station

Onstreet Parking

- 3 ADA Parking Spaces
- 20 Parking Spaces

Soccer Fields
-2 Soccer Fields 225 x 360
- Bleachers

6" Wide Patt
- Bench Seating Areas

Native Woodiand Area

=S

— = =——===— Property Line

oO®

Proposed Shade Tree with
Minor Soil Amendments
Proposed Shade Tree with
Major Soil Amendments

MASTER PLAN

upland

ININJOTIAIA XHVd OOVIIHIO 1LSIM




PIRyuleld T600'¥ST'ST8  Wod usisagpueldn

p11 udisaq puejdn
T 40T 38ed

880t'0SE°ZTE 03ed1yd

%S 1

%cl

%6

%9

%€

ajey uonelyu| pajewnsy Aleas

28'56¥'s68'L  $ | 80'95€°Z10°Y 19'9p5'02r'y _$ | 0L°00€'Sky'y $ | 90'292°685°) $ | aseud Jad [ejoL
L¥'598°220'L $ [3SOD [ej0L
08'8I¥'vLLL  $|29621'82.'L $|€Ev0v8189°L $ |¥elGS'Ge9’t $|90292685'L $ | 9e98hiLL $ Juswysiiqejs3 ealy |esneN
sozie'ozk  $ 8y'ge6'oLl ¢ 823 |Ind | - ¥noD |legieysed
65006'LF  $ 6 Sre'Er ¢ SpIal4 asN-HN
20210121 $ 612€2'60L _ $ Yinos - Jajeys anolo dludld 8UQ
26°12L'6€2 vo'sor'olz  $ YLON - SI9}I3yS SA0ID OIUdI] OM L]
vGLIGYIL  $ 89°026'689 ¢ uoljined Ayunwuwod
0T5S8'v0S'L $ LLYL9'6LY' L $|  swoonsay xesiun g - Bulpiing wioosay jseodid
21°009'G8Y vGLLG'eEy  $ SHNOD M3N Z - SUNOY Sluua)
8/0v9'ses ¢ gezeceeey  $ SUNOD M3N ¥ - SUNOD [[BG3I0ld
8LeeEL'9ls ¢ 899lG'eLr  $ asino sbusjieyn
06.66'912 ¢ ¥9'080'66L  $ uspse Aiosusg
96'6,0'8€8 ¢ 60°L¥9'06L  $ punoJbheid z|-Z
95°'926'eE) 62L.56LL  $ 107 Bunyed ynog
£2892'092 ¢ |6.'6€6'85C  $ 966os'esy ¢ 107 Bunyied [ejued
vL'122'918 8yro9z'6z. ¢ IIH PaIS
25902219 L6219'0¥S  $ yinos - sjiel) jeydsy
9Ev18'202 _ $ 68'20L'96L ¢ doo JauaQ - siied] yeydsy
z6geeoee  $ 8y'090'€0E ¢ YULON - sjiel jeydsy
: 18092 vIyv
8202 1202 avso - 9202 5202 202 3s09 Aewwng
y 9seyd € 9seyd ¢ ©seyd } 9seyd 0 @seyd

TLOT# obesiys 3som jo 11D

€202/90/L0 :91eq pasedaid

udisagpuejdn

juawdojanaq yied obedaiyd 3sep




Shelter at Tennis and Pickleball Courts

Tennis/Pickleball Courts
-2 Tennis Courts

- 4 Picieball Courts

- Picnic Tables

- Benches

Entrance Identifier
- Gateway Arch

- Sculpture

- Pollinator Gardens

sy

HTTTTTTTT

Playground Area

- 2-5 Play Structure

- 5-12 Play Structure

- Poured in Place Safety Surfacing
- Fabric Shade Sails

- Sensory Garden

Commun|
-40x

- 2 Unisex Restrooms
- Picnic Tables

Pavilion & Restroom
helter

Native Prairie Area

Central Parking Lot

- 4 ADA Parking Spaces
- 32 Parking Spaces

- Wheelstops

- Pedestrian Dropoff

Challenge Course
- Challenge Course Equipment
- Engineered Wood Fiber Safety Surfacing

Existing Monitoring Station

MASTER PLAN ENLARGEMENT

SCALE: 1" = 400"

]

200 40 80 120

ANJNdOTIAIA HHVd ODOVIIHD LSIM



Flower Talk Tubes

Multi-Textured Concrete Paving

Wind Chime Arcl
og Cookie Paths Through Senso

- Sensory Play Equipment
- Permable Pavers

2-5 Play Ar

Concrete Path Connection to
Pavilion with Ornamental Alley

Garden

s
- Group Hammocl
5 Swing Bay with ADA Seat
12 Swing Bay with ADA Seat
- Poured in Place Safety Surfacing

Table Seating with 16’ x 16’ Fabric Shade

Bench Seating with 16’ x 16’ Fabric Shade

8' Wide Asphalt Trail
nch Seating Area

PLAYGROUND ENLARGEMENT

&

SCALE: 1" = 400"

1

200 40

ANIINdOTIATA HAVd ODVIIHO LSIM



CITY OF WEST CHICAGO

PUBLIC AFFAIRS COMMITTEE
AGENDA ITEM SUMMARY
ITEM TITLE:
AGENDA ITEM NUMBER: “ A
CF Cycle for Life
Special Event Permit Application FILE NUMBER:

Cystic Fibrosis Foundation
COMMITTEE AGENDA DATE: August 21, 2023
COUNCIL AGENDA DATE:

STAFF REVIEW: Tom Dabareiner SIGNATURE @ -

APPROVED BY CITY ADMINISTRATOR:
Michael Guttman SIGNATURE

ITEM SUMMARY:

The Cystic Fibrosis Foundation is seeking approval for their CF Cycle for Life bike ride scheduled for
Saturday, September 23, 2023 from 8:00 a.m. — 2:00 p.m. with an estimate of 75 attendees. They will be
starting at Pollyanna in St Charles with routes utilizing the IL Prairie Path throughout DuPage County.
The estimated time that the riders will be in the West Chicago area is between 11:00 and 1:00pm.

The Special Event Permit Application has been reviewed and approved by staff from the Police, Public
Works, and Community Development Departments as well as the Park District and Fire Protection
District. The Special Event Permit Application is attached, which includes the course maps.

ACTIONS PROPOSED:

Recommend event for approval as proposed, contingent upon submittal and approval of required
insurance documentation.

COMMITTEE RECOMMENDATION:




City of West Chicago N

WEST CRICASO

SPECIAL EVENT PERMIT APPLICATION

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED IN FULL & SUBMITTED
90 DAYS PRIOR TO THE EVENT

PERMIT NO.

Special Event Permit Application

The Special Event Application must be submitted to the City of West Chicago a minimum
of ninety (90) days prior to the event if it requires closure of public streets, or use of public
parking lots and/or city personnel. The 90-day time period allows sufficient time to evaluate
the request and provide a recommendation to the City Council for its consideration. For
any late submittals (applications submitted less than 90 days prior to the event), a $50 late
fee must be paid with the application. Further, the applicant runs the risk of their Special
Event request being denied.

Note: Prior to review of the Special Events Permit Application, all applicants must
submit the Intent to Meet Insurance Requirements form (page 2).

Submittal Checklist

1. Completed and signed Special Event Application
o Intent to Meet Insurance Requirements
o Section 1 — General Information
o Section 2 — Narrative
o Section 3 — Permits
o Section 4 — Site Plan and/or Route Map
o Section 5 — Task List and Due Dates
o Section 6 — Hold Harmless Agreement

2. Completed and signed applications(s) for other permits(s) (See Section 3)
o Carnival Permit Application - $50 per employee
o Fireworks Permit Application —
$125 (Check made payable to the West Chicago Fire Protection District)
o Building Permit Application (temporary tents — see min. requirements) - $50
o Raffle Registration Application — requires separate application
o Temporary Liquor License Application — requires separate application
o Temporary Food Service Permit (DuPage Co. Health Dept. 630-682-7979)

R e L e e L T T T T T T Ty

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY
R L L T L T L L e T E T B g B o T e g S 222212033
. 9 {7 .
Received: l' ! s Fee Paid: $
Receipt # Check #

Event Acknowledgement Form returned by:

Police Dept. __ K Fire Dist. pw_ X pamoet X ~cob X

o Background checks completed by Police Dept. Date
o DuPage Co. Health Department notified Date e
o Certificate of Insurance received and approved Date 8/ 10 I 7?3)

Page 1 of 8



#** INTENT TO MEET INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS ***

Must be returned prior to application review by City staff

Prior to the issuance of a Special Event Permit, all organizations must
present a certificate of insurance meeting the criteria listed below:

1. Required limits per IML-RMA are $1mil per occurrence and general aggregate no less than
$2mil for contractors/vendors.

2. *™PLEASE NOTE: Under the box labeled “Description of
operations/locations/vehicles/exclusions added by endorsement/special provisions”, the
following language must appear:

“The City of West Chicago, its officials, agents, employees, and volunteers is/are named
additionally insured. The additional insured is covered as respect to liability arising out of any
work or activities performed on behalf of (company involved) for (event) (date, times (if
applicable), location) No endorsements or additional forms modify or limit coverage provided
to additional insured. Coverage provided to additional insured is primary as it relates to
(event)”.

3. Vendors shall furnish the additional insured endorsement (consult insurance professional;
examples include but are not limited to forms CG 2010 or CG 2026) to support the certificate
of insurance. The endorsement shall also name “The City of West Chicago, its officials,
agents, employees, and volunteers” as primary and non-contributory.

4. If applicable, vendor shall furnish the City with evidence of Worker's Compensation
coverage with statutory limits.

5. The insurance provider will need to submit the Certificate of Insurance and supporting

endorsement form preferably via email to specialevents@westchicago.org or fax
(630-293-1257) to be considered an original document.

Cystic Fibrosis Foundation

1, Meg Schneider , representing
(print name of authorized person) (organization)

have contacted the appropriate insurance provider and acknowledge that the above

insurance criteria can be met. | understand that the Special Event Permit Application

will not be reviewed until this document has been signed and returned to the City of

West Chicago.

(signature) (date)
CF Cycle for Life 9/23/23
(name of event) (date of event)

Page 2 of 8



SECTION 1 — GENERAL INFORMATION

Name of Event: Cycle for Life

Type of Event:
0O Parade X Walk/Run/Bike 0O Carnivals [ Fireworks [ Festival

O Other ___A bike ride utilizing the lllinois Prairie Path requiring no street closures

Location of Event: lllinois Prairie Path-Elgin Branch

Date(s) of Event: 09.23.23 Hours of Event: 8:00 AM t02:00 PM Est. Attendance: 75
Event Website: https://fightcf.cff.org/site/ TR/Cycle/45_Greater_lllinois_Chicago?pg=entry&fr_id=9961

A fully supported bike ride benefitting the Cystic Fibrosis Foundation that is starting at
Purpose of event: Pollyanna in St. Charles with routes utilizing the IL Prairie Path throughout DuPage Co.

Name of Sponsoring Organization(s): Cystic Fibrosis Foundation
Organization’s Legal Status (i.e. NFP, Partnership, Corporation): _Nonprofit Organization

Contact person from sponsoring organization: _Katie Page
Organizer address: 150 N Michigan Ave Suite 1550

City/State/Zip: _Chicago, IL 60601 Phone; 872-265-1010

Cell Phone: _872-265-1010 E-mail: kreardon@cff.org

Emergency contact information (provide mobile numbers for on-site coordinators during event):
1% Contact: _ Katie Page Phone: 872-265-1010

2" Contact: _Stephanie Meyer Phone: 872-265-1005

Is this an annual event? Kl Yes O No If Yes, provide next year's event date: 9/21/24

If the event is a recurring event, please state any problems and/or incidents that have occurred in past
years, such as noise or neighborhood parking complaints.
This is our first year riding on the lllinois Prairie Path, however, at our previous location there have been no

problems or incidents that have occurred

What, if anything, are you doing to rectify the problem(s)?

SECTION 2 - NARRATIVE

On a separate sheet, provide a detailed description of the overall event. The narrative will serve as
the special event proposal to City Council.

Page 3 of 8



SECTION 3 — PERMITS

Will your event include a carnival? o Yes XNo
If yes, you must submit a Carnival Permit Application ninety (90) days prior to the event.
Please visit www.westchicago.org under Forms for an application.

Does your event include the use of a temporary tent in excess of 400 sq. ft. in area with side curtains
or 700 sq. ft. in area without side curtains? o Yes gNo
If yes, you must submit a Building Permit Application thirty (30) days prior to the event.
Please visit www.westchicago.org under Forms for an application.

Will your event include a fireworks display? o Yes xNo
If yes, you must submit a Fireworks Permit Application thirty (30) days prior to the event.
Please visit www.westchicago.org under Forms for an application.

Are you holding a raffle at your event? o Yes X No
If yes, you must submit a Raffle Registration Application fourteen (14) days prior to the
event. Not all applicants will qualify for a license. Please visit www.westchicago.org under
Forms or contact the City of West Chicago at (630) 293-2200 ext. 170 for an application.

Will you be applying for a Temporary Liquor License? o Yes X No
If yes, you must submit a Temporary Liquor License Application thirty (30) days prior to the
event. To qualify for a Class D license, the applicant must be a local organization or group
providing beer and/or wine at a picnic, carnival or similar function. A Class D license shall be
authorized on a day-to-day basis but not for more than seven (7) consecutive days. Please
contact the City of West Chicago at (630) 293-2200 ext. 170 for an application.

Will you be serving food at your event? o Yes gNo
If yes, you may be required to submit a Temporary Food Service Permit Application thirty
(30) days prior to the event. Please contact the DuPage County Health Department at (630)
682-7979 or visit http://www.dupagehealth.orgtemporary-food-service for additional
information.

Are you requesting services from these departments?
O Police O Fire District / Paramedics [ Public Works

Specify services: We are requesting no services from any of your departments unless the City of West Chicago

requires we use their police department for any needed crossing guards.

Will you be utilizing any of the following services? No
O Water 0O Electric/Generator 0O Other

Page 4 of 8



SECTION 4 - SITE PLAN AND/OR ROUTE MAP
Please attach a separate sheet to illustrate the layout for your event.

If applicable, the following must be included:

Location of garbage receptacles (G) Location and number of barricades (B)

Location of toilets (T) Location of fire lane (FL)

Location of hand washing sinks (HWS) Location of fire extinguishers (FE)

Location of retail vendors (RV) Public entrances and exits (PE)

Location of food vendors (FV) Location of “No Firearms” signage (NF)

Location of first aid (FA) Location of sound stages and amplified sound (S)

Location of residential streets surrounding event

Are you requesting the use of any City-owned property, i.e. City streets, parking lots, or sidewalks?
X Yes 0O No If yes, please indicate the property that you are requesting to use.

Bike route is situated along the IL Prairie Path, going through West Chicago

Would you like to request the closing of City streets? O Yes No
If yes, please fill in the following information or submit a route map along with this application:
Street From To Dates Times

Page 5 of 8



q . & v S
2 Wing Park Fer 3 ) - The Water WOka T 3
bl 2 e & 1 Indoor r Water Park. \
Lords Park * o i !
I Elgm = ‘ & : = P - U‘
O,E"?.‘Tmly ECGIN MATIONAL (73) : Gﬂifg b SC"aumEETQ
Cotlege M osrhier C T~ | AN o <& . Fo Spring Valley
= el \ gé?t re . 5 @gf@ 4
9 y > ¥ T e = £ o core M
LY, & ; . Jain ySociety of B . b " Heritage Farm }
) ' Metropoman Chicago - > . == &
= A » : (19 g & & # *j. » 4 7 It
o ) - < < L, B
. # X o 5 Elk Grove
i { ok Lag im® Wintrust Field ¢ Yillage
; -~ ; % Hanover Park g ' i
¥ (&5 \ r R A Py - i
ms Bamett . Vs S g
b y !‘9‘/5}5 " t et (s - 2’."

5, 0NTAH|OV|LLE ‘f i < =\
r P | 5 : Roselle

- f r X a. e RN, *n,% s 'Mgding_h ‘
E i ¢ Q i ==

Keﬁﬁeywlle
rd Lake

Malla B 7
F oreisriPIreserve L

o
m E‘ % 3 t
(% R [ ey g

BAPS Shri S_:_N‘_a'ammarayan <
Mand;r Chlcago

* ‘cLovenpaL
: 1 Vertical Endeaﬁors‘o
;4(5Lendale Heights °
‘ . e «  East Branch
iy EMan S r o ‘ﬂJ ) ulendale Forest Preserve
b , = R ights  © '
DuPage Q Carol Stream @u’"
Airpont g
Authority (5 =3
W |

B

Wheaton
' College

P —— |

kayl:u:ard ahoftauts

Man datz 82023 Gaogle Terms of Uu.- Refsm & map amar




Stearns £ - \ = - NNy T R e |
eacns fic { Bartlett Aqﬁtic Center,' . 1 » : %
e | B H D Bike Path | ‘ MapView  « |
"Lampinght '\ i ' i .'I. [ ,
Equestnan Cemer‘ 4 i

B ; k ]

'] /4 =

L
.r",‘t

ickmar B0

rg

Anrpyy Tradt R

Shiri Swammarayan@
, dir Chtcago

o

L
lilinois Secretary of State

e A MBI S e

- b =
L ;,«‘»@J’ #os g
,,,,,,,, 2 o g
e Z DuPage &
et QN ‘ % Airport < \
. | Authority -
F Tyier Wi Q by == &
L i West Chicago lliinois : -

Secretary of State Facility

W Hawthoine Lit

e SERY

% ke Wes1Ch!cagoe ~ ‘ e ()
\ Community Hiah School Keyhoard shartcans  Map dete 2023 Goagle |

14 Tam&nftue ‘Pepmamapmaf.



SECTION § — PLANNING WORKSHEET AND REQUIRED TASK DUE DATES*

Use this form to determine the date each of these tasks needs to be completed. For tasks that do not apply,
please mark “N/A” in the Due Date column. If the Due Date falls on a weekend or holiday, the Due Date
becomes the next normal business day. However, this does not affect the other Due Dates, as they are only

dependent on the date of the special event.

Note: This section must be completed by event organizer prior to notary signature.

Date of Special Event:

(See IL State Police requirements for standardized
sign in West Chicago’s Special Events Policy)

Tasks to be completed Days Due
(All items due to City unless noted) Before Event Due Date

Submit “Intent to Meet Insurance Requirements” : : c ki
Document (included with Special Event Permit abili cPaEtliz;t?evi arh s t?e\alipeg‘)l:llcatlon
Application, pg.2) PP
Submit Special Event Permit Application 90 days
Submit Carnival Permit Application 90 days
Submit Fireworks Permit Application 30 days
Submit Temporary Liquor License Application 30 days
Submit Building (Temporary Tent) Permit

LT 30 days
Application
Submit Temporary Food Service Permit
Application(s) 30 days
(DuPage County Health Dept. — 630-682-7979)
Submit Original Certificate of Insurance* 21 days*
Submit Raffle Registration Application 14 days
Notify residents/businesses of special event 14 days
Post “No Firearms” signs at all public entrances

N/A Day of Event

*If this requirement is not met, the proposed event may be cancelled.

Page 6 of 8




SECTION 6 — WAIVER AND HOLD HARMLESS AGREEMENT

In consideration of the _Cystic Fibrosis Foundation (name of organization) and its Members,
employees, volunteers or guests, being allow to participate in _CF Cycle for Life , (the Activity) the
undersigned hereby recognizes, acknowledges and assumes any and all risk pertaining to

Cystic Fibrosis Foundation  (name of organization) participation in the Activity.

To the fullest extent permitted by law, the CYstic Fibrosis Foundation (name of organization)
hereby agrees to defend, indemnify and hold harmless the City of West Chicago, its officials, agents and
employees, against all injuries, deaths, loss, damages, claims, suits, liabilities, judgments, cost and

expenses (including attorneys fees), which may in anywise accrue against the City of West Chicago, its
officials, agents and employees, arising in consequence of _Cystic Fibrosis Foundation  (name of
organization) participation in the Activity, or which may in anywise result therefore, except that arising out
of the sole legal cause of the City of West Chicago, its agents or employees. The

Cystic Fibrosis Foundation  (name of organization) shall, at its own expense, appear, defend and

pay all charges of attorneys and all costs and other expenses arising therefore or incurred in connections
therewith, and, if any judgment shall be rendered against the City of West Chicago, its officials, agents
and employees, in any such action, the ___ Cystic Fibrosis Foundation (name of organization) at

its own expense, satisfy and discharge the same.

The invalidity or unenforceability of any of the provisions hereof shall not affect the validity or
enforceability of the remainder of this Agreement.

The undersigned represents it has full authority to execute this Waiver and Hold Harmless Agreement on
behalf of the _Cystic Fibrosis Foundation (name of organization).

Agreed this day of , 20

Cystic Fibrosis Foundation
Name of Organization

Meg Schneider
Print Name of Authorized Person

Signature of Authorized Person

Executive Director
Title

Page 7 of 8



The Organization and the authorized signatory below agree to inform the City of West Chicago of any
changes in the application at least thirty (30) days prior to the event. Please note: Final approval of
this event is pending satisfactory completion of Certificate of Insurance requirements.

Signatory agrees to abide by all requirements of the Special Events Policy, including
compliance with the State of lilinols Firearm Concealed Carry Act.
*All applications must be signed and notarized.

Cystic Fibrosis Foundation (\(\Q & ‘3\_\'\(\ Q:Chf 8 / 3 ’ l.?

(Date)

(Namof Organization) \(\ 3 ((PJint Name of Signatory)
o WO o dlg v
A i n", O )

: Officia Seal
L

Notary Public - State of Itiinois

My Commission Expires May 12, 2026 (Notary Public)

Signed and swom to before me this__ (3 dayof __FUIQUSH 20 2%,

J
After submitting all forms, your application will be reviewed by City staff. All departments that will be
involved in providing services or permits for the event will be notified. Please do not assume that all

aspects of the event will be approved. You may be asked to make some changes to your plan
based on the availabllity of services or scheduling of other events.

The City of West Chicago reserves the right to cancel any event at any time for reasons deemed
necessary by the City Council and/or City Administrator.

Deliver all completed items to:
City of West Chicago
Attn: Community Development — Special Events
475 Main Street
West Chicago, IL 60185

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY

Based on the information which has been submitted and contingent upon approval of any necessary inspections
the day of the event, the request for a permit has been:

O Approved Permit No.
£P ) O Denied

Remarks:

Authorized Signature

Title Date

Page 8 of 8




CITY OF WEST CHICAGO

PUBLIC AFFAIRS COMMITTEE
AGENDA ITEM SUMMARY

ITEM TITLE:
AGENDA ITEM NUMBER: “+. 6.
AN ORDINANCE MODIFYING :
CHAPTER 4, ARTICLE I, BUILDING CODE, FILE NUMBER:
OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES
COMMITTEE AGENDA DATE: A t 21, 2023
OF THE CITY OF WEST CHICAGO e SINCINACE DAEATEL: -t

ORDINANCE NO. 2023-0-0029

7
STAFF REVIEW: Stuart J Caravello, Chief Building Official SIGNATURE

APPROVED BY CITY ADMINISTRATOR: Michael Guttman SIGNATURE

ITEM SUMMARY:

The City of West Chicago Building Code currently enforces the 2015 International Building Code with
amendments. This ordinance would be an adoption of the 2021 International Building Code which would allow the
City of West Chicago to enforce the latest edition of the International Building Code as set forth by the
International Code Council.

No significant changes have been made to the International Building Code, but by adopting the latest edition of the
building code we will be in compliance with International Code Council mandates of adopting a code within three
cycles.

The international Code Council updates the building code every three years. (2012, 2015, 2018, 2021 etc.)

ACTIONS PROPOSED:

Consideration of the proposed adoption to the 2021 International Building Code and lllinois Plumbing
Code with amendments:

International Residential Code, 2021 w/ Appendixes A-K inclusive
International Building Code, 2021 w/ Appendixes F-J inclusive
National Electrical Code (NEC), 2020

International Fire Code, 2021

International Mechanical Code, 2021

International Fuel Gas Code, 2021

International Existing Building Code, 2021

International Swimming Pool and Spa Code, 2021

lllinois State Plumbing Code, 2014 (State statute)

lllinois Accessibility Code, 2018 (State statute)

International Property Maintenance Code, 2021

International Energy Code, 2021 (State statute)

NFPA 101 - Life Safety Code, 2021 (State statute)




CITY OF WEST CHICAGO

COMMITTEE RECOMMENDATION:

Attached - Building Code Update




- CODE OF ORDINANCES
Chapter 4 - BUILDINGS AND BUILDING REGULATIONS
ARTICLE I. BUILDING CODE

ARTICLE I. BUILDING CODE!*

Sec. 4-1. Administration.

(a) Title. This article shall be known as the "Building Code of the City of West Chicago."

(b)  Purpose and intent. The purpose of this article is to provide safety, health and public welfare through
structural strength and stability, means of egress, adequate light and ventilation and protection to life and
property from fire and hazards incidental to the design, construction, alteration, removal, or demolition of
buildings or structures.

(c) Article as remedial. This article shall be construed to secure its expressed intent, which is to ensure public
safety, health and welfare insofar as they are affected by building construction, through structural strength,
adequate egress facilities, sanitary facilities, light and ventilation and fire safety; and, in general, to secure
safety to life and property from all hazards incidental to the design, erection, construction, alteration,
removal or demolition of all buildings and structures.

(d) Application and scope of regulations.

(1)  Application of provisions: This article shall control all matters concerning the construction, alteration,
addition, repair, removal, demolition, use, location, occupancy and maintenance of all buildings and
structures, and shall apply to existing or proposed buildings and structures; except as such matters are
otherwise provided for in other ordinances or statutes, or in the rules and regulations authorized for
promulgation under the provisions of this article.

(2) Compliance with provisions: No building or structure shall be constructed, extended, repaired, removed
or altered in violation of these provisions except for repairs as defined in subsection (3) of this section,
and except further, that the raising, lowering or moving of a building or structure as a unit necessitated
by a change in legal grade or widening of a street shall be permitted, provided the building or structure
is not otherwise altered or its use or occupancy changed.

(3) General repairs and maintenance: Ordinary repairs to structures may be made without application or
notice to the city, but such repairs shall not include the cutting away of any wall, partition, or portion
thereof, the removal or cutting of any structural beam or bearing support, or the removal or change of
any required means of egress, or rearrangement of parts of a structure affecting the exit requirements;
nor shall ordinary repairs include addition to, alteration of, replacement or relocation of any standpipe,
water supply, sewer, drainage, drain leader, gas, soil, waste, vent or similar piping, electric wiring or
mechanical or other work affecting public health or general safety.

(4) Conflicting provisions: When the provisions contained in this article conflict with any other provision
contained in the City Code or in any state or federal statute, the most restrictive or rigid provisions
shall control.

(e) Existing structures, structures moved into city.

!Editor's note(s)—Ord. No. 04-0-0100, § 1(Exh. A), adopted Dec. 6, 2004, deleted the former Art. |, §§ 4-1—4-11,
and enacted a new Art. | as set out herein. The former Art. | pertained to similar subject matter. For
complete derivation see the Code Comparative Table and the end of this volume.

West Chicago, lllinois, Code of Ordinances Created: 2022-11-28 09:11:45 [EST]
(Supp. No. 139)

Page 1 of 48



(1)

()

3)

(4)

(5)

(6)

It shall be unlawful to use or occupy any building or structure, or part thereof, in violation of the
provisions of this article, except as otherwise provided for in this Code.

The legal use and occupancy of any structure existing on the date of adoption of this article which has
been heretofore approved, may be continued without change, except as may be specifically provided
for in this article.

Alterations or repairs may be made to any structure without requiring the existing structure to comply
with all the requirements of this article, provided such work conforms to that required of a new
structure. Alterations or repairs shall not cause an existing structure to become unsafe or adversely
affect the performance of the building.

Alterations or repairs to an existing structure which are nonstructural and do not adversely affect any
structural member or any part of the structure having a fire resistance rating may be made with the
same materials of which the structure is constructed.

In the event a building or structure is altered or repaired beyond fifty (50) percent of its present size or
physical value, the city may require that the entire building or portions thereof be brought into
compliance with all provisions of this article.

Buildings and structures moved into or within the city shall comply with the provisions of this article for
new buildings and structures and shall not be used or occupied in whole or in part until the certificate
of occupancy has been issued by the city.

(f)  Buwilding-efficial Chief Building Official.

(1)

Defined: Whenever in this article the term “building-official~ “Chief Building Official” is used, it shall
mean that person appointed by the eity-adwministrater City Administrator. That officer is hereby
authorized and has the duty to administer and enforce the provisions of the building code, making such
determinations, interpretations, and orders as are necessary therefore, and requiring such plats, plans
and other descriptive material in connection with applications for permits as are necessary to judge
compliance with this article.

(g8) General requirements.

(1)

()

3)

(4)

(5)

License required: All contractors performing work within city limits are required to obtain a license as
specified in Chapter 9, Article Il of this Code.

Exception: Unless otherwise established by an approved intergovernmental agreement.

Occupation of streets or other public property: Streets or other public property shall not be occupied
with building materials unless approved by the building-efficial Chief Building Official, subject to such
conditions as the buiding-efficial Chief Building Official deems necessary.

Barricades required: Any person using streets or other public property for storage or construction shall
provide substantial and suitable barricades and shall provide, place and maintain proper and sufficient
lights or flares to guard and protect all traffic and passersby.

Damage to barricading: It shall be unlawful to move, remove, turn off, extinguish, diminish or disturb
any light or barricades required by subsection (g)(3) above.

Removal of rubbish—Public property: Rubbish or excavated material which is deposited on any street
or other public property shall be removed from day to day, as rapidly as produced. Trash containers or
dumpsters shall not be placed on streets unless otherwise approved in advance by the building official
and must, where possible, be located a minimum of five (5) feet from the curb. Trash containers shall
be placed in such a manner that they do not obstruct the vision of motorists or interfere with
pedestrian traffic.

Created: 2022-11-28 09:11:44 [EST]

(Supp. No. 139)

Page 2 of 48



(h)

(6)

(7)

(8)

Removal of rubbish—Private property: Rubbish or surplus materials shall not be thrown, dropped or
swept from any floor above the ground or from any roof, but shall either be carried or lowered in such
a manner as not to cause dust, and shall be removed from day to day, or placed in an approved
noncombustible container and shall be protected in such a manner as not to be blown or scattered
onto adjacent properties. Trash containers or dumpsters shall be located on private property and no
closer than five (5) feet to the property line.

Public inconvenience: All building operations shall be conducted in a manner that least inconveniences
the public and abutting property owners.

Protection of passersby: Where during construction an excavation or other hazard exists five (5) feet or
less from a public way, the contractor shall provide and maintain a barricade or fence for the
protection of passersby.

Building permits.

1)

()

3)

Permit required: No person shall begin the erection, construction, alteration or repair, demolition or
movement of any building or structure in the City of West Chicago, or begin the clearing or excavating
of the site of any proposed building or structure, or construct or maintain any driveway in or across any
public walk, parkway or curb, without first having applied for and obtained a permit in writing to do so
from the city.

Application for permit: An application for a permit shall be submitted in such form as the building
effieial Chief Building Official may prescribe. Such application shall contain the full name and address of
the applicant and of the owner, and if the owner is a corporate body, of its responsible officer. The
application shall also list all subcontractors, addresses, phone numbers and a brief description of work
to be performed and such additional information as may be required by the building-efficial Chief
Building Official for an intelligent understanding of the work proposed.

Required plans and information:

a.  Grading plan: At the time of applying for a permit to construct a principal building, the applicant
shall submit copies of a plat of topographic survey of the lot and grading plan prepared by an
Illinois Registered Professional Engineer, and shall indicate all information as otherwise required
by the city engineer.

b.  Plans, drawings, etc.: Plans, drawings, specifications and calculations meeting all requirements of
the building code shall be presented to the building-efficiat Chief Building Official for approval
before a permit will be issued. Plans shall specifically show all design loads and occupant
capacities for all spaces and floors and shall be prepared and sealed by a registered architect
licensed in the State of lllinois.

Exception: Working drawings in sufficient detail to describe the character of the work proposed
are required for single-family residential additions, alterations, remodeling and accessory
structures.

c.  Torelocate a principal building, or, relocate or construct an accessory building greater than five
hundred seventy-six (576) square feet, the applicant shall submit the same information as
indicated above unless otherwise approved by the building-efficial Chief Building Official or city
engineer.

d.  Proof of compliance; improvements: A permit shall not be issued until satisfactory proof has been
submitted that an adequate and approved water supply and sewerage facilities are available;
that surface and roof drainage will not damage adjoining properties; that, to maintain the public
safety because of the activity on the property, public pedestrian walks and curbs are provided;

Created: 2022-11-28 ©9:11:44 [EST]

(Supp. No. 139)

Page 3 of 48



(4)

(5)

(6)

()

(8)
(9)

(10)

(11)

(12)

and that access for police and fire equipment is provided on a satisfactory, hard surface, all
weather roadway.

Alteration of plans: It shall be unlawful to erase, alter or modify any lines, figures or coloring contained
upon drawings or plans bearing the approval stamp of the building official, or filed with him for
reference. If during the progress of the execution of such work, it is desired to deviate in any manner
affecting the construction or other essentials of the building from the terms of the application or
drawing, notice of such intention to alter or deviate shall be given to the building-efficial Chief Building
Official and approval of an amended plan showing such alteration or deviation shall be obtained before
such alteration or deviation shall be made.

Revocation of permit: The building-official Chief Building Official may revoke a permit issued in case
there has been any false statement or misrepresentation as to a material fact in the application or
plans on which the permit or approval was based.

Permit for moving building or structure: Before a building or structure may be moved, the owner or
agent shall notify all utilities having service connections within the building or structure such as water,
electric, gas, sewer any other connections. A permit for moving a building or structure shall not be
issued until all utilities having service connections within the structure have been removed or sealed
and plugged in a safe manner. Route approval shall be required from the public services department
and a five thousand dollars ($5,000.00) cash bond deposited.

Commencement notice to be given: The building-efficial Chief Building Official shall be given at least
twenty-four (24) hours' notice of the starting of work under a permit.

Payment of fees: A permit shall not be issued until all required fees have been paid.

Compliance with article: The permit shall be a license to proceed with the work and shall not be
construed as authority to violate any of the provisions of this article, except as specifically stipulated by
modification or variation.

Compliance with permit: All work shall conform to the approved application and plans for which the
permit has been issued and any approved amendments thereto.

Compliance with grading plan—Spot survey required: All new work shall be located strictly in
accordance with the approved grading plan. Two (2) copies of the platted survey, prepared by an
Illinois Registered Professional Land Surveyor shall be filed with the building-efficiat Chief Building
Official within fourteen (14) days after foundation is placed. No construction will be permitted over the
foundation except for water, sewage and related items unless such platted survey has been filed and
approved by the building official.

The spot survey shall indicate the following:

a. Elevations of the top of foundation walls shall be labeled at each corner and at every break point
if steps in the foundation occur.

b.  All dimensions of foundation walls.
c.  Actual front, side, and rear yard setbacks.
Extension and expiration of building permit or application for building permit:

a. If, after a building permit required by this article shall have been granted, the operation called for
by such permit shall not have been started within six (6) months after the date thereof, such
permit shall be void and no operation hereunder shall be begun.

b.  Where, under authority of a permit, work has begun and has not been prosecuted for a
continuous or cumulative period of six (6) months, as determined by the building-effieial Chief

Created: 2022-11-28 09:11:44 [EST]

(Supp. No. 139)

Page 4 of 48



Building Official, all rights under such permits shall thereupon terminate and work may be
continued only after application for and issuance of a new permit. If, after a period of thirty (30)
days following the expiration of a permit, no subsequent permit has been issued, all structures or
portions thereof shall be removed and the site shall be returned to its original condition.

Where, under authority of a permit, work has not been completed within one (1) year after the
issuance of such permit and an occupancy permit issued, all rights under such permit shall
thereupon terminate and work may be continued only after application for and issuance of a new
permit. Where the construction process is expected to exceed one-year time in completion, a
schedule of completion shall be provided at the time of application for permit.

The fee for extending a permit shall be one-half () the amount required for a new permit for
such work, provided no changes have been made in the original plans and specifications for such
work, and provided that such abandonment has not exceeded six (6) months.

Any application for a building permit that is approved but has not been issued within six (6)
months of notification of said approval by the city shall be void.

Any application for a building permit where the applicant has failed to respond to any request for
additional information, including but not limited to plan reviews and contractor information for a
period of more than six (6) months, said application shall be void.

No voided building permit application may be renewed. No re-application for a previously voided
permit application shall be accepted until which time all fees owed for plan review and out-of-
pocket expenses have been paid. The code in effect for a permit re-application will be that in
effect at the time said re-application is accepted.

(13) Permits for sewer and water repairs: Permits are required for sewer and water repairs. All work must
be performed in accordance with the plumbing code listed in section 4-4 of this article. All parkways
must be restored to their original condition within two (2) weeks of completion of sewer and water
repairs. Any sidewalk, which is damaged or removed, must be replaced immediately. The contractor is
responsible to ensure that the excavation is performed in a safe manner and suitable protection for the
general public shall be provided. Sewer and water excavations on private property shall be compacted,
leveled and restored to natural grade within six (6) months of the date of the issuance of the permit.

(i)  Demolition of buildings or structures.

(1) Application: Along with a completed permit application; the following information is required for
submittal for a demolition permit:

a.

Service connections: For other then sewer and water services under direct control of the city, the
owner or agent shall notify all utilities having service connections within the structure such as
electric, gas, cable, telephone and other connections of intent to demolish before a permit may
be issued. The contractor shall submit an affidavit certifying that the respective service
connections and appurtenant equipment, such as meters and regulators, have been removed or
sealed and plugged in a safe manner.

Well and septic: An approved and executed copy of the DuPage County Health Department site
evaluation permit.

City water and sewer: A copy of the city's inspection report, signed by the city administrator, or
his designee, indicating sewer and water services have been disconnected, inspected and
approved as part of a valid permit issued for disconnection of said utilities for the
property/structure in question.

Survey/plot plan: A survey or plot plan showing the buildings or structures to be demolished and
the buildings or structures to remain.

(Supp. No. 139)

Created: 2022-11-28 ©9:11:44 [EST]

Page 5 of 48



()

3)

(4)

(5)

(6)

(7)

(8)

(9)

e.  Environmental review: A Phase | (NESHAP) environmental report for demolition of commercial
and industrial structures.

f. Collateral: Cash, certified check, an irrevocable letter of credit or some other surety instrument
from a company authorized by the department of insurance to sell sureties in lllinois shall be
deposited with the city, in an amount equal to one hundred twenty-five (125) percent of the cost
of demolition, as determined by a written estimate from the contractor and/or the building
offieial Chief Building Official.

Notice to adjoining owners: Written notice shall be given to the owners of adjoining lots and to the
owners of wired or other facilities, of which the temporary removal of any service is necessitated by
the proposed work, before demolition of a building or structure may begin.

Notice to building-efficied Chief Building Official: Should a person causing a demolition excavation to be
made is not afforded license to enter an adjoining structure, that person shall immediately notify in
writing both the building-efficial Chief Building Official and the owner of the adjoining property that the
responsibility of providing support to the adjoining lot, building or structure has become the exclusive
responsibility of the owner of the adjoining property.

Lot regulation: Whenever a structure is demolished or removed, the premises shall be maintained free
from all unsafe or hazardous conditions by the proper regulation of the lot, including temporary
fencing or other measures, restoration of established grades and planting vegetation as detailed
herewith, and the erection of the necessary retaining walls and fences. Temporary fencing is subject to
the requirements of appendix A, section 7.1 of this Code.

Grading of lot: Where a structure has been demolished or removed and a building permit has not been
approved, the vacant lot shall be filled, graded and maintained in conformity to the established
elevation of the street grade at curb level nearest to the point of demolition. Provision shall be made to
prevent the accumulation of water or damage to any foundations on the premises or the adjoining
property.

Acceptable fill: Any foundations, footings or other below ground structures must be removed or
pulverized into acceptable fill. Concrete containing metal reinforcement shall not be used as fill. Any
basements or trenches must be filled with approved material.

Removal of debris: All waste materials shall be removed in a timely manner so as to prevent injury or
damage to persons, adjoining properties and public rights-of-way.

Planting of grass: After any demolition of building(s) and after removal of debris there from, black
topsoil shall be spread four (4) inches deep over the entire surface of the building site; and the soil shall
be seeded for grass or sodded within thirty (30) days of demolition or the commencement of
seasonable weather. Once seeded or sodded, the grass shall be maintained. If seeding, appropriate
erosion control measures must be taken until such seed is established as approved by the building
official.

Complete removal: Demolition must include the removal of all foundations, septic tanks, stoops, slabs,
private sidewalks, driveways and any other abandoned structures.

(i) Inspections.

(1)

()

Preliminary inspections: Before issuing a permit, the building official may examine or cause to be
examined all buildings, structures and sites for which an application has been filed. Safe access to all
work being inspected must be provided at all times.

Required inspections:

Created: 2022-11-28 09:11:44 [EST]

(Supp. No. 139)

Page 6 of 48



Inspections required under the provisions of this article shall be made by the building-official
Chief Building Official. If an inspection has been scheduled and, in the opinion of the building
official, after arrival on the inspection site, the job is not ready or has not progressed to a point
where an inspection can be made properly, or if access is not possible to perform the inspection,
or if the job site has not been maintained free from excessive construction debris, or, upon re-
inspection, not all previously identified code violations have been corrected, a seventy-five dollar
($75.00) re-inspection fee may be charged. No further inspections shall be made until the re-
inspection fee has been paid.

The owner or contractors are required to call the building department a minimum of twenty-four
(24) hours in advance, but no later then 1:00 p.m. the day before, for any inspection. Required
inspections include, but are not limited to the following:

1.  Footing: Before concrete is poured and after footing and pier excavation has been
completed and all form work and steel reinforcement is complete.

2.  Foundation wall: Prior to placement of concrete when reinforcing steel is required in a
foundation.

3. Drain tile: Before backfilling, after placement of footing drain tile, after window wells are
attached, gravel has been placed and the walls have been damp-proofed or waterproofed.

4.  Sewer connection: Before any backfill and after house sewer has been tapped into sanitary
sewer.

5.  Water connection: Before any backfill and after installation of the service pipe, main valve
inside the building, and pressurization of the service line.

6 Electrical service: At the time the electrical service is to be energized or re-energized.

7. Underground electrical: After underground electrical is installed and before it is covered
over.

8.  Rough electrical: Before any insulation, vapor barriers or wall finish is applied and after the
rough electric is complete. Wires must be pulled at the time of inspection.

Exception: Wires need not be pulled at the time of inspection for remodeling work or when
otherwise approved.

9.  Underground plumbing: After under slab plumbing is installed and before covering.

10. Rough plumbing: Before any insulation, vapor barriers or wall finish is applied and after the
rough plumbing is completed.

11. Framing: Before any insulation, vapor barrier or wall finish is applied, after rough electric,
plumbing and HVAC are approved and the framing is complete.

12. Insulation: Before any interior wall finish is applied and after insulation and vapor barriers
are completed.

13. Ceiling inspection: Prior to the placement of suspended ceiling panels.

14. Concrete slab: Before any concrete floor or garage slabs are poured, after underground
electric and plumbing are approved, and after insulation and vapor barriers are installed.

15. Concrete driveway: After stone base is set and formwork installed. A proof-roll inspection
of the driveway base may be required.

16. Asphalt driveway: After stone base is set. A proof-roll inspection of the driveway base may
be required.

(Supp. No. 139)

Created: 2022-11-28 ©9:11:44 [EST]

Page 7 of 48



(k)

()

3)

(4)

(5)

17. Public sidewalk: After formwork is installed and prior to pour.

18. Final inspection: After all work is completed and building is to be approved for issuance of
certificate of occupancy.

19. Other: Any other inspection that may be specifically required by the building-efficiat Chief
Building Official.

Obstruction of inspection: No work shall be done which will cover or obstruct from view construction
work scheduled for inspection which is not yet approved by the building-efficiat Chief Building Official.

Approval: As each stage or item of construction is approved, the approval shall be recorded by the
building-official Chief Building Official in his official records thereby authorizing the continuation of the
work.

Right of entry: In the discharge of duties, the building-efficial Chief Building Official shall have the
authority to enter at any reasonable hour any building, structure or premises in the jurisdiction to
enforce the provisions of this article.

Stop work orders.

(1)

()

3)

Authority: Whenever the building-official Chief Building Official finds any work regulated by this article
being performed in a manner either contrary to the provisions of this article, or, dangerous or unsafe,
the building-efficial Chief Building Official is authorized to issue a stop work order.

Issuance: The stop work order shall be in writing and given to the owner of the property involved, or to
the owner's agent, or to the person doing the work. Upon issuance of a stop work order, the cited work
shall immediately cease. The stop work order shall cite the reason for the order, and the conditions
under which the cited work will be permitted to resume.

Unlawful continuance: Any person who shall continue any work after being served with a stop work
order, except such work that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition,
shall be subject to the penalties provided for in section 1-8(a) of this Code.

Occupancy permits.

(1)

Definitions:

a.  "Change of occupancy", as used in this section, shall refer to any person or persons: 1) assuming
actual occupancy or possession of or acquiring the right to occupy or possess any existing
building or structure or unit thereof or of vacant property pursuant to the surrendering of such
by another person or persons; or 2) assuming actual occupancy or possession of or acquiring the
right to occupy or possess any abandoned real estate. "Change of occupancy" shall not refer to,
and the requirements of this section shall not apply to, a purchaser, landlord or sublessor of an
existing building or structure or unit thereof or of unimproved property who acquires the right to
occupy and possess such incident to a sale or the termination of a lease or sublease, provided
that such purchaser, landlord or sublessor shall continue to seek to sell, lease or sublet such and
does not actually occupy or use such. In addition, "Change of occupancy" shall not refer to, and
the requirements of this section shall not apply to, a change of residential tenants or lessees
occupying a dwelling unit that is subject to the requirements of Chapter 9, Article XV of the City
Code, "Licensing of Residential Rental Property".

b.  "Unit", as used in this section shall refer to a "dwelling unit," as defined in section 9-301,
Definitions, of Article XV, Licensing of Residential Rental Property, of the City Code; and for all
other kinds of real estate, to any building or structure or to any office or room or suite of offices
or rooms, store front, condominium unit, unit, or permanently partitioned area or areas within

Created: 2022-11-28 09:11:44 [EST]

(Supp. No. 139)

Page 8 of 48



such that are separately conveyed, demised, or occupied or intended to be separately conveyed,
demised, or occupied.

"Building permit", as used in this section, shall also include permits for work such as mass
grading, parking lot construction, stormwater improvements, watermain and sanitary sewer
improvements and other engineering-related projects of a similar nature.

"New construction" as used in this section, shall also include any construction requiring a building
permit.

(2) City's right to prosecute violations: The issuance of an occupancy permit or temporary occupancy
permit shall not stop the city from prosecuting, or operate as a waiver of any right of the city to
prosecute, an owner or occupant of any real estate for any violation of any city ordinance.

(3) Payment to city: No occupancy permit or temporary occupancy permit shall be issued by the city when
any applicant owes the city any money for any purpose whatsoever.

(4) Issuance of permit: No occupancy permit shall be issued except upon the approval of any two (2) of the

following:

a.  City administrater Administrator

b.  Director of eommunity-development Community Development
c.  Director of administrativeserviees Finance

d. Buildingefficial Chief Building Official

e.  Building inspeeter Inspector

(5) Change of occupancy or use:

a.

General regulations:

1.  No change of occupancy without an occupancy permit: Except as provided for herein, there
shall be no change of occupancy or use of any existing building or structure or unit thereof
or of unimproved property unless, prior thereto, an occupancy permit shall first have been
obtained from the city certifying that the building, structure, unit or unimproved property
and the proposed use comply with all provisions of the City Code. Every application shall be
filed with the building official and be in such form and contain such information as the
building official shall provide by general rule. An occupancy permit fee as prescribed in
Appendix G of the City Code shall be paid at the time of filing the application.

2.  Inspection and approval: Except as provided herein, no occupancy permit shall be issued
until the premises shall have been inspected and determined to be in full and complete
compliance with all of the provisions of the City Code. The city shall complete a re-
inspection within five (5) business days of receiving a request for such.

3. Re-inspection: If any existing building, structure or unit thereof or unimproved property
fails the inspection, all violations of this article and of other provisions of the City Code shall
be corrected by the owner, contractor or other person responsible, who shall thereafter
notify the city that the premises are ready for re-inspection. The city shall complete a re-
inspection within five (5) business days of receiving a request for such.

Issuance of a temporary occupancy permit: A temporary occupancy permit may be issued only
when an application for an occupancy permit has been made pursuant to this section and the
application is pending. The city may issue a temporary occupancy permit only when
noncompliance with the requirements of the City Code would not pose an immediate threat to
the health, safety or welfare of the occupants. Such temporary occupancy permit may be issued

(Supp. No. 139)

Created: 2022-11-28 ©9:11:44 [EST]

Page 9 of 48



for a period not to exceed ninety (90) days from its date of issuance, pending the correction of
any deficiencies. The building-official Chief Building Official may, upon expiration of an initial
temporary occupancy permit, issue not more than one (1) renewal thereof for an additional
period not to exceed ninety (90) days.

1.

A letter-of-intent, signed by the grantee, transferee, mortgagee or lessee and notarized,
accepting full responsibility without condition for correction of all deficiencies, shall be
submitted with any application for a temporary occupancy permit. Such temporary
occupancy permit shall be subject to such terms and conditions as the city deems
appropriate.

A cash bond, in an amount equal one thousand five hundred dollars ($1,500.00) per
dwelling unit for residential properties, and three thousand dollars ($3,000.00) for
nonresidential properties, plus a nonrefundable administrative fee as prescribed in
Appendix G of the City Code, shall be submitted with any application for a temporary
occupancy permit. The cash bond shall be returned only when all deficiencies have been
corrected; no partial refunds shall be given. A cash bond shall not be required for
residential properties when the party/parties otherwise responsible for the bond can
provide a copy of current FHA 203k documents for the existing deficiencies at the subject
property. The applicable administrative fee (as prescribed in Appendix G of the City Code)
shall be required.

Expiration of temporary occupancy permits. Upon the expiration of any temporary
occupancy permit or extension thereof, the city may cause the premises to be vacated and
to remain vacant until full compliance with all applicable ordinances has been obtained.

When the permittee has failed to obtain an occupancy permit prior to the expiration of a
temporary occupancy permit, the city shall transfer the cash bond to the general corporate
fund of the city and use it for any purpose it deems appropriate, including to offset the cost
of ensuring code compliance on the property of the permittee.

(6) New construction:

a.

General regulations:

1.

No occupancy without an occupancy permit: No structures or additions thereto
constructed, moved, remodeled or reconstructed pursuant to a building permit, and no
land improved pursuant to a building permit, shall be occupied or used for any purpose
unless an occupancy permit or temporary occupancy permit shall first have been obtained.
Every application for a building permit shall be deemed an application for an occupancy
permit.

Completion of work: Except as provided herein, no occupancy permit shall be issued for a
structure or addition thereto constructed, moved, remodeled or reconstructed pursuant to
a building permit, or for land improved pursuant to a building permit, until all work
encompassed by the permit has been completed and the premises have been inspected by
the building-efficial Chief Building Official and determined to be in full and complete
compliance with the plans and specifications upon which the issuance of the building
permit was based.

Re-inspection: If any newly constructed, moved, remodeled or reconstructed building or
structure or addition thereto or unit thereof, or any improved land, fails the inspection
required for issuance of an occupancy permit, all violations of this article and of other
provisions of the City Code shall be corrected by the owner, contractor or other person

(Supp. No. 139)

Created: 2022-11-28 09:11:44 [EST]

Page 10 of 48



responsible, who shall thereafter notify the city that the premises are ready for re-
inspection. The city shall complete re-inspections within five (5) days of notification.

4.  Land improvements: For a building, structure or improvement to land for which a building
permit has been issued, the following improvements and documentation shall be provided
by the permittee prior to the issuance of an occupancy permit:

vi.

vii.

viii.

Xi.

The buffalo (water shut-off) box shall be adjusted to grade, and be accessible
and operable.

All public and private sidewalks on and immediately adjacent to the lot shall be
completed.

Any replacement or repair to damaged curbs and gutters, streets, sidewalks,
driveways and street lighting shall be completed.

All final grading within the lot and parkway areas shall be completed, and a final
topographical survey shall be submitted indicating that the grading has been
completed in compliance with the approved subdivision or site grading plan
and that all overland storm water flow conforms with said grading plan.

All required yards and parkway areas shall be sodded or seeded and a
homogeneous grass surface shall be satisfactorily established.

Trees of an approved species shall be planted in all parkway areas. The species,
number and spacing of such trees shall be in conformance with applicable city
regulations.

All other required landscaping shall be installed.
Address numbers shall be affixed to the building.

For single family homes, a final as-built plan shall be submitted showing all final
as-built dimensions of all buildings and/or structures erected. The city shall
review and approve the as-built drawings before the public improvements are
accepted by the city and prior to final occupancy. The plan shall show all
easements, setbacks, utilities, elevations, grades, slopes, drainage routes,
sidewalks, utility services, trees, and other items as required. The plans must be
signed and sealed by a professional engineer or surveyor licensed in the state.

For multi-family, commercial, and subdivision developments, electronically
produced as-built engineering drawings of the permitted subdivision and/or
design improvements shall be submitted within fifteen (15) months of the date
of permit issuance. The city engineer shall review and approve the as-built
drawings before the public improvements are accepted by the city and prior to
final occupancy.

As-built engineering drawings shall be based on the original approved
engineering plans and shall show all items depicted in the original approved
plan(s) for all existing and proposed onsite and offsite improvements. The as-
built engineering drawings shall accurately depict the as-constructed location,
grade, slope, profile, elevation, contour, rim, invert, stage/storage/volume,
specified lid or grate, detail, size, length, etc., for all improvements as shown on
the originally approved plans. Additionally, the as-built location of all
streetlights and associated conduits and control equipment, installed parkway
trees, and all recorded easements shall be clearly shown on the plan sheets for
verification purposes. As-built items deviating from their approved design may

(Supp. No. 139)

Created: 2022-11-28 09:11:44 [EST]

Page 11 of 48



require additional documentation prior to approval. The as-built engineering
drawings shall be signed and sealed by a professional engineer or surveyor
licensed in the state.

xii.  After approval of the as-built engineering drawings, final mylar and digital as-
built engineering drawings shall be submitted to the city. Digital as-built
submissions shall comply with the formatting set forth by the city's geographic
information system (G.1.S.) department. In the event that the subdivision
and/or design plans are not submitted in a format compatible with the city's
geographic information system, an additional fee shall be charged as prescribed
in Appendix G of the City Code.

xiii. In addition to the as-built requirements, other items including, but not limited
to, deed of conveyance/bill of sale for public improvements to be conveyed to
the city, original lien waivers, easements, and maintenance securities may be
required prior to final occupancy and project close-out.

Temporary occupancy permits: A temporary occupancy permit may be issued, provided that the
only deficiencies from the requirements of the City Code are those listed in this section and that
all of the conditions of this section are met. Prior to issuance of any temporary occupancy permit
where a water service is installed or replaced, the water meter and the remote reader shall be
installed and a conduit shall be provided for the installation of the remote water meter reader
cable.

1. Atemporary occupancy permit may be issued only when noncompliance with the
requirements of the City Code would not pose an immediate threat to the health, safety or
welfare of the occupants. Such temporary occupancy permit may be issued for a period not
to exceed ninety (90) days from its date of issuance, pending the correction of any
deficiencies. The building-efficial Chief Building Official may, upon expiration of an initial
temporary occupancy permit, issue not more than one (1) renewal thereof for an
additional period not to exceed ninety (90) days.

2.  Where the deficiencies from the requirements of the City Code pertain to a structure or
improvement other than a building intended for occupancy, a temporary occupancy permit
may only be issued according to the following schedule and for the following reasons:

i Between July 1 and August 31, temporary occupancy permits may be issued
only for sod and seed installation and landscape planting not being completed,
and only if adverse weather conditions existing during that time period
prevented such installation or planting, based on nursery/landscape industry
standards. A temporary occupancy permit issued pursuant to this paragraph
shall expire on September 30 of that year.

ii. Between December 1 and May 1, temporary occupancy permits may be issued
only for the following items not being completed.

(i) Parkway tree planting.

(ii)  Final grading, provided that the lot is rough graded to drain away from
building and no drop-offs exist adjacent to installed sidewalks.

(ili) Sidewalk installation.

(iv) Driveway paving, so long as gravel is placed the full limits from curb to
the house.

(v) Submittal of final as-built survey.

(Supp. No. 139)

Created: 2022-11-28 ©9:11:44 [EST]

Page 12 of 48



(vi) Sod and seed installation and landscape plantings.

A temporary occupancy permit issued pursuant to this paragraph shall expire on May
1 of that year. Temporary occupancy permits pending completion of these items may
be issued prior to December 1, or extended beyond May 1, if the city, in its sole
discretion, determines that adverse weather conditions, or other circumstances
beyond the control of the applicant, would prevent the items from being completed.

iii.  Acash bond, in an amount equal to one hundred fifty (150) percent of the city's
estimated cost to correct all deficiencies, plus a nonrefundable administrative
fee as prescribed in Appendix G of the City Code, shall be submitted with any
application for a temporary occupancy permit pursuant to a building permit.
The cash bond shall be returned only when all deficiencies have been
corrected; no partial refunds shall be given. At the time of posting the cash
bond, the applicant and the proposed occupant of the property shall provide
written permission to the city and its contractors to enter upon the property to
complete the required items. If all deficiencies are not corrected within the
time frames specified herein for specific deficiencies, or within one hundred
eighty (180) days after the initial issuance of the temporary occupancy permit,
whichever is shorter, the city shall transfer the cash bond to the general
corporate fund of the city and use it for any purpose it deems appropriate,
including to offset the cost of ensuring code compliance on the property of the
permittee.

(7)  Expiration of temporary occupancy permits: Upon the expiration of any temporary occupancy permit or
extension, thereof the city may cause the premises to be vacated and to remain vacant until full
compliance with all applicable ordinances has been obtained.

(8) If inspection of any premises establishes that it cannot be occupied due to violations of the City Code,
the city may post a "No Occupancy" notice on such structure. Should a structure be posted, said
posting shall remain until the premises are brought sufficiently into compliance with the City Code so
that a permanent or temporary occupancy permit may be issued.

(9) Yielding of occupancy: Occupancy of any premises shall not be yielded to any person until an
occupancy permit or a temporary occupancy permit has been posted. No person shall take occupancy
of any premises without an occupancy permit or temporary occupancy permit having been issued.

(10) Disclaimer: By the issuance of an occupancy permit or temporary occupancy permit, the city does not
warrant the condition of any property inspected to the owner thereof or to any other person and shall
not be liable to any person for any claims arising out of the property or the condition thereof. The city
does not warrant that all property deficiencies are listed in the inspection report and does not warrant
anything as to the condition of the property or the liability therefore.

(11) Discontinuation of water service: If no application for an occupancy permit has been made to the city
prior to any premises becoming vacant or within seven (7) days thereof, the city, at its sole discretion,
may discontinue water service to such premises until such time that the building-efficial Chief Building
Official determines that water service to such premises may resume.

(12) Violation: Any owner of real estate or his representative who enters into an agreement for the sale,
lease or transfer of property for which an occupancy permit is required hereunder and who fails to
advise the person or persons named in such agreement as the purchaser, lessee or transferee in
writing that an occupancy permit is required pursuant to such sale, lease or transfer shall be subject to
a fine as prescribed in section 1-8 of the City Code. However, such owner's or representative's failure
to so advise shall neither excuse the failure of the purchaser, lessee or transferee from applying for an

Created: 2022-11-28 09:11:44 [EST]
(Supp. No. 139)

Page 13 of 48



occupancy permit nor preclude him from any liability hereunder for failure to do so, or prohibit the city
from taking any action authorized hereunder as a result of the failure to obtain an occupancy permit.

(m) Emergency measures.

(n)

(o)

(p)

(q)

(r)

(1) Vacating structures: When, in the opinion of the building-efficial; Chief Building Official, there is actual
and immediate danger of failure or collapse of a building or structure or any part thereof which would
endanger life, or when any structure or part of a structure has fallen and life is endangered by the
occupation of the building or structure, the building-efficial Chief Building Official is hereby authorized
and empowered to order and require the occupants to vacate the same forthwith. The building-efficial
Chief Building Official shall post the building or structure as uninhabitable at each entrance. It shall be
unlawful for any person to enter such building or structure except for the purpose of making the
required repairs or demolishing the same.

(2) Temporary safeguards: When, in the opinion of the building-efficial Chief Building Official, there is
actual and immediate danger of collapse or failure of a building or structure or any part thereof which
would endanger life, the building-efficial Chief Building Official shall cause the necessary work to be
done to render such building or structure or part thereof temporarily safe.

(3) Closing streets: When necessary for the public safety, the building official may temporarily close
sidewalks, streets, buildings and structures, and places adjacent to such unsafe structures and prohibit
the same from being used.

Off-street parking. All off-street parking and loading facilities, including driveways and pavement, shall be
constructed in accordance with all provisions contained in the subdivision regulations ordinance and the
zoning ordinance of the city, and such provisions are hereby incorporated into the building code of the city
by reference, as if fully set forth herein.

Numbering of buildings.

(1) Required: All houses, buildings and structures within the city shall be numbered in accordance with the
regulations set forth by the city.

(2) Duty to affix, visibility: It shall be the duty of the owner or occupant of every house, building, or
structure in the city to have placed thereon, so as to be clearly visible from the street, figures showing
the number of the house, building, or structure. The minimum height of letters and numbers shall be
four (4) inches set on a visually contrasting background.

Installation of sidewalks. Each and every person applying for a building permit for the construction of a
building upon any vacant lot or tract of land within the city shall install a sidewalk or sidewalks, at such place
or places on said lot or tract of land and at such grade and manner as the city may require.

Newly improved property to bear share of cost of local government services. Prior to the issuance of a
certificate of occupancy, the building inspector shall file an unexecuted certificate of occupancy with the
Wayne or Winfield Township Assessor, whichever is appropriate, and the owner of the property for which
said occupancy permit is requested shall obtain from either the Wayne or Winfield Township Assessor, in the
form prescribed by said official, a receipt showing that the unexecuted certificate of occupancy has been
duly filed and that the property is subject to increased assessment from the date of issue of the certificate on
a proportionate basis for the year in which the improvement was completed. The owner of said property
shall file the receipt with the building department of the city and the building inspector shall file a certified
copy of the certificate of occupancy, when issued, with the Wayne or Winfield Township Assessor.

Cleanup during construction.

(1) As a condition of the issuance of a building permit, the contractor or other person to whom a building
permit is issued must provide noncombustible trash containers or dumpsters on the building site
during the entire construction period. Said containers or dumpsters shall be located on private

Created: 2022-11-28 09:11:44 [EST]

(Supp. No. 139)

Page 14 of 48



(s)

(t)

(u)

()

3)

property and shall be protected or covered in such a manner so that the contents thereof are not
blown or scattered onto adjacent properties. They shall be placed no closer than five (5) feet from the
property line and in such a manner that they do not obstruct the vision of motorists or interfere with
pedestrian traffic. This requirement shall be applicable only to the construction of new buildings or
structures or the renovation, remodeling, demolition or repair of existing buildings or structures or
portions thereof or to any other activity for which a building permit is required where, in the
reasonable judgment of the building-efficial; Chief Building Official such activity is likely to produce
debris, rubbish and surplus materials in a significant volume. For purposes of this section, the terms
"building" and "structure" shall have the same definitions as in the city's zoning ordinance.

Rubbish, surplus materials or other debris including, but not limited to, pieces of wood, drywall,
insulation and piping, shall not be thrown, dropped or swept from any floor above the ground or from
any roof, but shall either be carried or lowered in such a manner as not to cause dust. Cleanup of all
rubbish or surplus materials or other debris located on the building site shall be accomplished on a
daily basis.

In addition, the contractor (or other person to whom the building permit is issued) must clean up mud
or other rubbish or surplus materials, or other debris, including, but not limited to, pieces of wood,
drywall, insulation, and piping, deposited on the streets or other public property of this city by any
vehicles, trucks or pieces of equipment serving the building site. The eleanr-up clean-up must be
accomplished within a reasonable time after notice from the city.

Construction hours. No construction, erection, excavation, or any other process of building whatsoever, shall
be performed within the city before the hour of 7:00 a.m. or after 8:00 p.m., Monday through Friday and
before the hour of 8:00 a.m. or after the hour of 7:00 p.m. on Saturday and Sunday.

Violation. Any person, firm or corporation violating any provision of this article shall be, upon judicial finding,
subject to a fine per section 1-8 of this Code. A separate offense shall be determined to have been
committed each day during which or on which the violation occurs or continues.

(1)

Violation penalties first time violation(s): Any person who shall be subject to penalties as provided for
in this article and who: (i) receives a first violation(s) in connection with a particular parcel; and (ii) has
submitted adequate proof of full compliance with the City Code and proof that the subject violation(s)
has been remedied, as determined by an administrative law judge before, or at, the first administrative
hearing, shall be liable for a fine reduced by seventy-five (75) percent, provided said fine shall be paid
at the initial administrative adjudication hearing.

Appeals. Any person directly affected by a decision of the building-efficial Chief Building Official or a notice or
order issued under this Code shall have the right to appeal to the building board of appeals as provided for in
Chapter 2 of this Code.

(1)

()

3)

Application for appeal: Any person directly affected by a decision of the building-efficial Chief Building
Official or a notice or order issued under this Code shall have the right to appeal to the board of
appeals, provided that a written application for appeal is filed within twenty (20) days after the day the
decision, notice or order was served. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that the true
intent of this Code or the rules legally adopted hereunder have been incorrectly interpreted, the
provisions of this Code do not fully apply, or the requirements of this Code are adequately satisfied by
other means.

Notice of meeting: The board shall meet upon notice from the building-official Chief Building Official,
within twenty (20) days of the filing of an appeal, or at stated periodic meetings.

Open hearing: All hearings before the board shall be open to the public. The appellant's representative,
the building-efficial Chief Building Official and any person whose interests are affected shall be given

Created: 2022-11-28 ©09:11:44 [EST]

(Supp. No. 139)

Page 15 of 48



(4)

(5)

(6)

(7)

(8)

9)

the opportunity to be heard. A quorum shall consist of not less than two-thirds (%) of the board
membership.

a.  Procedure: The board shall adopt and make available to the public through the secretary
procedures under which the hearing shall be conducted. The procedures shall not require
compliance with strict rules of evidence, but shall mandate that only relevant information be
received.

Postponed hearing: When the full board is not present to hear an appeal, either the appellant of the
appellant's representative shall have the right to request a postponement of the hearing.

Board decision: The board shall modify or reverse the decision of the building official only by a
concurring vote of a majority of the total of the total number of appointed board members. The board
shall have the discretion to allow a variance from the provisions of the code if, after having received a
written report, certified by a licensed architect or engineer, the board of appeals determines that strict
compliance with the code is impractical from an engineering, architectural or structural standpoint,
and not simply unaffordable, that the spirit and intent of the code has been met and life safety has not
been materially compromised as a result of the variance.

Records and copies: The decision of the board shall be recorded. Copies shall be furnished to the
appellant and to the building-efficial: Chief Building Official.

Administration: The building-efficial Chief Building Official shall take immediate action in accordance
with the decision of the board.

Court review: Any person, whether or not a previous party of the appeal, shall have the right to apply
to the appropriate court for a writ of certiorari to correct errors of law. Application for review shall be
made in the manner and time required by law following the filing of the decision in the office of the
chief administrative officer.

Stays of enforcement: Appeals of notices and orders (other than those of immediate threat to life
safety) shall stay the enforcement of the notice and order until the appeal is heard by the appeals
board.

(Ord. No. 04-0-0100, § 1(Exh. A), 12-6-2004; Ord. No. 06-0-0008, § 1(Exh. A), 2-6-2006; Ord. No. 06-0-0004, § 2a—
2m, 3-6-2006; Ord. No. 06-0-0076, § 2a—m, 9-5-2006; Ord. No. 08-0-0082, § 2, 11-3-2008; Ord. No. 10-0-0039, §§
1, 2, 4-19-2010; Ord. No. 11-0-0031, § 1, 8-1-2011; Ord. No. 12-0-0049, § 1, 12-3-2012; Ord. No. 14-0-0020, § 1, 7-
7-2014; Ord. No. 15-0-0017, §§ 1, 2, 7-6-2015)

Editor's note(s)—Ord. No. 15-0-0017, §§ 1, 2, adopted July 6, 2015, shall be in full force and effect on Aug. 1, 2015.

Sec. 4-2. Industrial, commercial, multifamily building code.

(a) There is hereby adopted by reference as if fully set out herein that certain code known as the "2045-2021
International Building Code", including Appendixes C and F—J inclusive, as published by the International
Code Council, Inc., together with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes hereinafter set forth, one
(1) copy of which has been on file for a period of more than thirty (30) days prior to the adoption of this
section and is now on file in the office of the eity-clerk: City Administrator or designee.

(b) Amendments. The following additions, insertions, deletions and changes are hereby made to the above-
adopted code:

101.1 Title. Insert "City of West Chicago" where indicated.

105.2 Work exempt from permit. Delete in its entirety.

312.1 General. Amend this section by adding the following language at the end of the paragraph:

Created: 2022-11-28 ©9:11:44 [EST]

(Supp. No. 139)

Page 16 of 48



"Other non-habitable or detached accessory structures as determined by the Building Official"
412.4.6 Fire suppression. Delete this section in its entirety and substitute the following new language:

"412.4.6 Fire suppression. Any airplane hangar, which exceeds either of the following limitations, shall comply with
NFPA 409 (Standard on Aircraft Hangars) - 2016 Edition;

1. Asingle fire area more than 50,000 square feet in area.
2. A hangar door greater than 33 feet in height.

Exception: Group Il hangars, as defined in NFPA 409, storing private aircraft with or without
major maintenance or overhaul are exempt from foam suppression requirements."

507.3 Nonsprinklered, One-Story. Delete in its entirety.
Section 901.6.1 Automatic sprinkler systems. Modify this section by deleting Exception #2.

[F] 903.2.1 Group A. Delete this section and all subsections in its entirety and substitute the following new
sections:

"[F] 903.2.1 Group A. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all Group A-1, A-2, A-3 and A-4
occupancies.

[F] 903.2.1.1 Group A-5. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group A-5
occupancies in the following areas: concession stands, retail areas, press boxes and other
accessory use areas in excess of 1,000 square feet."

[F] 903.2.2 Group B ambulatory health care facilities. Delete this section in its entirety and substitute the following
new section:

“[F] 903.2.2 Group B. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all Group B
occupancies."

[F] 903.2.3 Group E. Delete this section in its entirety and substitute the following new section:

"[F] 903.2.3 Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all Group E
occupancies."

[F] 903.2.4 Group F-1. Delete this section and all subsections in their entirety and insert the following new section:

"[F] 903.2.4 Groups F-1 & F-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all Group F-
1 and F-2 occupancies."

[F] 903.2.5.3 Pyroxylin plastics. Delete this section in its entirety.
[F] 903.2.7 Group M. Delete this section in its entirety and substitute the following new section:

“[F] 903.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all Group M
occupancies."

[F] 903.2.9 Group S-1. Delete this section and all subsections in their entirety and insert the following new section:

"[F] 903.2.9 Groups S-1 & S-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all Group S-
1 and S-2 occupancies.

EXCEPTION: Buildings used primarily for the bulk storage of road salt."

[F] 903.2.10 Group S-2. Delete this section and all subsections in their entirety and insert the following new
section:

"[F] 903.2.10 Group U. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all occupiable
spaces of Group U exceeding 1,000 square feet (93 m?)"

Created: 2022-11-28 ©9:11:44 [EST]
(Supp. No. 139)

Page 17 of 48



"Exception: Group U agricultural buildings as identified in Appendix C."
[F] 903.2.11.1 Stories without openings. Delete this section and all subsections in their entirety.

[F] 903.2.11.3 Buildings over 55 feet in height. Exception: Delete this section in its entirety and substitute the
following new section:

[F] 903.2.11.3 Airport control towers. Automatic sprinkler systems are not required to be installed in
airport control towers.

[F] 903.4 Sprinkler system supervision and alarms. Exceptions: 2, 3, 4, 5, 6 and 7. Delete in their entirety.
SECTION 903 AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEMS, amend by adding thereto the following new section:

"903.6 System diagram. A diagram indicating all areas served by the control valves shall be posted
adjacent to the risers and/or control valves."

(F) 905.1 General. Amend the end of the first paragraph with following: “All required standpipes shall be Class 1
standpipes”

[F] 905.3 Required installations. Amend by adding thereto the following new sections [F] 905.3.9 and [F] 905.3.9.1:

"[F] 905.3.9 All other buildings. Standpipes shall be installed in areas where horizontal or vertical access
is more than one hundred fifty (150) feet beyond the level of fire department vehicle access. Distance
is measured starting from the fire department apparatus' hose connection.

(F) 905.3.9.1 Locations. Where a standpipe system is required by this section there shall be Class
1 hose connections at each required exit door on each floor. All grade level exit doors with
adjacent standpipe hose connections shall have approved label measuring 12-inch square,
permanently affixed in a conspicuous location on the exterior side of the door with plainly legible
wording stating “FD HOSE VALVE”. The lettering shall be a contrasting color to the background
and easily readable.

SECTION 905 STANDPIPE SYSTEMS, amend by adding thereto the following new sections:

"905.11 Water supply. When installed as required above, water flow requirements for standpipes shall
be one hundred fifty (150) gpm at one hundred (100) psi at each outlet with a maximum of six hundred
(600) gpm.

905.12 Hose connections. All hose connections shall be a minimum of a 2% inch hose outlet with a
gated valve, a 2% inch to 1% inch reducer with national standard thread and a 1% inch cap."

[F] 907.2 Where required—new buildings and structures. Delete the first paragraph in its entirety and substitute
the following language:

"[F] 907.2 Where required—new buildings and structures. An approved addressable fire alarm system
installed in accordance with the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided in new buildings
and structures in accordance with Sections 907.2.1 through 907.2.23 and provide occupant notification
in accordance with Section 907.5, unless other requirements are provided by another section of this
code. Fire alarm system shall only include that necessary for required operation of the system and not
include other components for security or burglar alarm functions, etc."

[F] 907.2.1 Group A. Delete the first paragraph and the exception in its entirety and substitute the following
language:

Created: 2022-11-28 09:11:44 [EST]
(Supp. No. 139)

Page 18 of 48



"[F] 907.2.1 Group A. An automatic fire alarm detection system shall be installed and maintained in all
new occupancies of Group A."

[F] 907.2.1.1 System initiation in Group A occupancies with an occupant load of 1,000 or more. Delete the first
paragraph in its entirety and substitute the following language:

"[F] 907.2.1.1 System initiation in Group A occupancies with an occupant load of 500 or more.
Activation of the fire alarm in Group A occupancies with an occupant load of 500 or more shall initiate
a signal using an emergency voice/alarm communications system in accordance with Section
907.5.2.2."

[F] 907.2.2 Group B. Delete the first paragraph and the exception in its entirety and substitute the following
language:

"[F] 907.2.2 Group B. An automatic fire alarm detection system shall be installed and maintained in all
new occupancies of Group B with a total gross building area over five hundred (500) square feet."

[F] 907.2.3 Group E. Delete the first paragraph and the exceptions in their entirety and substitute the following
language:

"[F] 907.2.3 Group E. An automatic fire alarm detection system shall be installed and maintained in all
new occupancies of Groups E."

[F] 907.2.4 Group F. Delete this paragraph in its entirety and substitute the following language:

"[F] 907.2.4 Group F, S and U. An automatic fire alarm detection system shall be installed and
maintained in all new occupancies of Groups F, S and U with a total gross building area over five
hundred (500) square feet."

[F] 907.2.5 Group H. Delete the first sentence in its entirety and substitute the following language:

"[F] 907.2.5 Group H. An automatic fire alarm detection system shall be installed and maintained in all
new occupancies of Group H."

[F] 907.2.6 Group I. Delete the first sentence in its entirety and substitute the following language:

"[F] 907.2.6 Group I. An automatic fire alarm detection system shall be installed and maintained in all
new occupancies of Group I."

[F] 807.2.6.1 Group I-1. Delete the first exception in its entirety.
[F] 907.2.7 Group M. Delete this section in its entirety and substitute the following language:

"[F] 907.2.7 Group M. An automatic fire alarm detection system shall be installed and maintained in all
new occupancies of Group M."

[F] 907.2.8 Group R-1. Delete this section in its entirety and substitute the following new section [F] 907.2.8:

“[F] 907.2.8 Group R-1. An automatic fire alarm detection system shall be installed and maintained in
all new occupancies of Group R-1."

[F] 907.2.8.1 Manual fire alarm system. Delete this section in its entirety.
[F] 907.2.9 Group R-2. Delete this section in its entirety and substitute the following new section [F] 907.2.9:

"[F] 907.2.9 Group R-2. An automatic fire alarm detection system shall be installed and maintained in
all new occupancies of Group R-2."

[F] 907.2.9.1 Manual fire alarm system. Delete this section in its entirety.

907.5.1.1 Presignal feature. Delete this section in its entirety.

Created: 2022-11-28 @9:11:44 [EST]
(Supp. No. 139)

Page 19 of 48



907.5.2.3 Visible alarms. Delete this section in its entirety and substitute the following new paragraph:

"907.5.2.3 Visible alarms. Visible alarm notification appliances shall be provided in accordance with
Sections 907.5.2.3.1 through 907.5.2.3.5."

907.5.2.3 Visible alarms. Amend by adding thereto the following language new sections 907.5.2.3.4 and
907.5.2.3.5:

"907.5.2.3.4 Tenant space light. Each tenant space in a multiple tenant building shall have an audio
visual alarm visible in a public access area indicating which tenant space has the activated alarm.

907.5.2.3.5 Outside alerting device. All fire alarm and fire suppression systems shall have outside
alerting devices of a type and at a location approved by the building-efficiat Chief Building Official.

907.6.6 Monitoring. Delete the exceptions in their entirety.
[F] 909.1 Scope and purpose. Amend by adding the following new subsections 909.1.1 and 909.1.2:

"[F] 909.1.1 Required smoke control systems. In addition to that required elsewhere in this code, an
emergency smoke control system shall also be provided in new construction as indicated below. Unless
otherwise prohibited elsewhere by this code, activation shall be by manual control located at the
smoke control panel specified in Section [F] 909.16.

1. In all buildings with a fire area exceeding forty thousand (40,000) square feet of floor area.
Plenums and sub-floors enclosed within a defined fire area separation do not require separate
smoke control or exhaust systems.

2. In all buildings over three (3) stories or thirty-five (35) feet in height.
3. In covered mall buildings including individual tenant spaces."

Exception: Unlimited area buildings providing smoke and heat venting or a mechanical exhaust
systems as required by Section 910.

[F] 909.1.2 Design parameters. Smoke control systems shall be designed to provide a minimum of 2 air
changes per hour.

910.4.5 Manual control location. Delete this section in its entirety and substitute the following new paragraph:

910.4.5 Manual control location. Manual controls shall be at a location approved by the fire code
official so as to be easily accessible to the fire service from an exterior door of the building and

protected against interior fire exposure by not less than 1-hour fire barriers constructed in accordance
with Section 707 or horizontal assemblies constructed in accordance with Section 711, or both.

CHAPTER 11 ACCESSIBILITY, delete this chapter in its entirety.

1612.3 Establishment of flood hazard areas. Insert "DUPAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS AND INCORPORATED AREAS"
where indicated.

1612.3 Establishment of flood hazard areas. Insert “September2004" “August 1, 2019” where indicated.

(Ord. No. 04-0-0100, § 1(Exh. A), 12-6-2004; Ord. No. 06-0-0004, § 4, 3-6-2006; Ord. No. 11-0-0006, § 1, 3-7-2011;
Ord. No. 11-0-0031, § 1, 8-1-2011; Ord. No. 15-0-0017, § 3(Exh. A), 7-6-2015; Ord. No. 18-0-0055, § 1, 12-17-
2018; Ord. No. 19-0-0016, §§ 1, 2, 5-6-2019)

Editor's note(s)—Ord. No. 15-0-0017, § 3(Exh. A), adopted July 6, 2015, shall be in full force and effect on Aug. 1,
2015.

Created: 2022-11-28 09:11:44 [EST]

(Supp. No. 139)

Page 20 of 48



Sec. 4-3. Single-family building code.

(a) Adopted. There is hereby adopted by reference, as if fully set out herein, that certain code known as the
2015-nternational-Residential-Code;" “2021 International Residential Code,” including Appendix Chapters A
through K inclusive, M and U, as published by the International Code Council, Inc. together with the
additions, insertions, deletions and changes hereinafter set forth, one (1) copy of which has been [on file] for
a period of more than thirty (30) days prior to the effective date hereof and now is on file in the office of the
eity-elerk City Administrator or designee.

(b) Amendments. The following additions, insertions, deletions and changes are hereby made to the above-
adopted single-family building code:

R101.1 Title. Insert: "City of West Chicago".
R105.2 Work exempt from permit. Delete this section in its entirety.

R109.1.1 Foundation inspection. Delete from the last sentence the wording "and special requirements for
wood foundations".

SECTION R112 BOARD OF APPEALS. Delete this section in its entirety insert the following new sections:

"R112.1 General. In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by
the building-efficial Chief Building Official relative to the application and interpretation of this code,
there shall be and is hereby created a board of appeals. The board of appeals shall be appointed by the
applicable and governing authority and shall hold office at its pleasure. The board shall adopt rules of
procedure for conducting its business.

R112.2 Limitations on authority. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that the true intent
of this code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been incorrectly interpreted, the provisions
of this code do not fully apply or an equally good or better form of construction is proposed. The board
shall have no authority to waive requirements of this code.

R112.3 Qualifications. The board of appeals shall consist of members who are qualified by experience
and training to pass on matters pertaining to building construction and are not employees of the
jurisdiction."

Table R301.2 (1) CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA. Delete in its entirety and in lieu thereof
substitute the following new Table 301.2(1):

TABLE 301.2(1)
CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA

WIND DESIGN SEISMIC SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM WINTER ICE FLOOD AIR MEAN
GROUND DESIGN DESIGN BARRIER HAZARDS | FREEZING | ANNUAL
SNOW CATEGORY TEMP UNDER- INDEX TEMP
LOAD LAYMENT
REQUIRED
Topographic Frost Termite
Speed effects Weathering line
(mph) depth
25 Ib/ft? 90 NO B Severe 42" Moderate -2 YES DuPage 2000 45
to heavy County
Ord. No.
OSM-
001-
99

Created: 2022-11-28 ©9:11:44 [EST]
(Supp. No. 139)

Page 21 of 48



Table 301.5 MINIMUM UNIFORMLY DISTRIBUTED LIVE LOADS. Change the live load indicated for "Balconies
(exterior) and decks" from "40" to "60."

R303.1 Habitable rooms. Amend by adding the following new section:

"R303.1.1 Basements. All basements shall be provided with an aggregate glazing and ventilation area of
not less than one (1) percent of the gross floor area."

R303-9 R303.10 Required heating. Amend by adding the following new section:

“R303.9-1 “R303.10.1 Closets. All closets greater than thirty-six square feet (36 ft?) and having at least
two exterior walls shall be provided with heating as required above."

SECTION R303 LIGHT, VENTILATION AND HEATING. Amend this section by adding the following new section

“R303-10 “R303.11 Habitable basement spaces. All habitable basement spaces shall be free of excess
moisture, dampness and ground water seepage. All unnecessary moisture shall be removed by
mechanical or gravitational means."

R309.5 Fire Sprinklers. Delete this section in its entirety and insert the following new section:

"309.5 Service door. All detached garages shall be provided with a side-hinged service door not less
than two (2) feet eight (8) inches in width and 1 3/8 inches thick."

SECTION R309 GARAGES AND CARPORTS. Amend by adding the following new section 309.6:

309.6 Driveways. All garages and/or carports shall be accessible by driveways constructed of a
minimum of four (4) inches of concrete over four (4) inches of compacted gravel, or, 2 1/2 inches of
bituminous asphalt over six (6) inches of compacted gravel or other approved materials. Paved
approaches located in the public right-of-way shall comply with Section 15-4 of the Code of Ordinances
of the City of West Chicago."

R310.1 Emergency escape or rescue required. Amend by adding the following wording at the end of this section:

"Rooms such as studies, dens, libraries, etc., which contain closets shall be classified as a sleeping room
and require emergency escape openings."

R301.2.1 Minimum opening area. Amend this section by adding the following new section 310.2.1.1:

"R310.2.1.1 Basement escape windows. All required basement emergency escape windows shall have a
minimum area of nine square-feet (9 ft?), a minimum height of thirty-six inches (36") and a minimum
width of thirty-three inches (33"). Sill height shall not be more than forty-four inches (44") above the
floor."

SECTION R311 MEANS OF EGRESS. Amend this section by adding the following new sections R311.2.1 and
R311.2.2.:

"R311.2.1 Bedroom doors. All bedroom doors shall be a minimum of thirty inches (30") wide by six feet
eight inches (6'8") high and one and one quarter inches (1-%") thick. The doors shall be provided with
latching hardware, and side hinges.

R311.2.2 Locking methods. No locks or locking mechanisms requiring the use of a key to operate are
permitted on bedroom doors"

R313.2 One- and two-family dwellings. Delete this section and subsections in their entirety.
R314.2 Where required. Amend by adding the following wording at the end of the section:

"Rooms such as studies, dens, libraries, etc., which contain doors providing privacy and closets shall be
classified as a sleeping room."

Created: 2022-11-28 ©09:11:44 [EST]
(Supp. No. 139) §

Page 22 of 48



R401.1 Application. Delete in its entirety and insert the following new section 401.1:

"R401.1 Application. The provisions of this chapter shall control the design and construction of the
foundation and foundation spaces for buildings. In addition to the provisions of this chapter, the design
and construction of foundations in flood hazard areas as established by Table R301.2(1) shall meet the
provisions of Section R322. Footings and foundations of wood shall not be permitted"

R401.2 Requirements. Modify by deleting the last sentence.
R402.1 Wood foundations. Delete this section in its entirety.
R402.1.1 Fasteners. Delete this section in its entirety.
R402.1.2 Wood treatment. Delete this section in its entirety.
R403.1 General. Delete the wording "wood foundations," from the first sentence.
Figure R403.1 (2) PERMANENT WOOD FOUNDATION BASEMENT WALL SECTION. Delete in its entirety.
Figure R403.1 (3)PERMANENT WOOD FOUNDATION CRAWL SPACE SECTION. Delete in its entirety.
R403.1.1 Minimum size. Modify by deleting the last sentence.
R403.1.1 Minimum size. Amend by adding the following new section R403.1.1.1:

"R403.1.1.1 Grade beams. Grade beam construction for detached accessory structures shall consist of a
four inch (4") concrete floor on a minimum four inches (4") of crushed stone, sand and gravel poured
monolithically with a minimum ten inches (10") thickened outer edge a width of twenty inches (20")
around perimeter of building, said twenty inch (20") grade beam to be of equal depth on undisturbed
soil."

R403.1.4.1 Frost protection. Delete the three (3) Exceptions and insert the following new exceptions:
Exceptions:

1. Grade beam construction is permitted for detached residential accessory structures not
exceeding five hundred seventy six square feet (576 ft2) and/or where no one dimension exceeds
twenty-four feet (24').

2. Sheds, grade-level detached decks and other accessory buildings, two hundred (200) square
feet or less and not used for storage of motor vehicles, may provide a four (4) inch concrete slab
for a foundation/floor, or, may be placed on grade w/o posts provided all underlying organics are
removed and a 4" sand or gravel base is provided.

3. Decks not supported by a frost protected structure need not be provided with footings that
extend below the frost line."

R403.2 Footings for wood foundations. Delete this section in its entirety.
R404.2 Wood foundation walls. Delete this section in its entirety.
R404.2.1 Identification. Delete this section in its entirety.

R404.2.2 Stud size. Delete this section in its entirety.

R404.2.3 Height of backfill. Delete this section in its entirety.

Table R404.2.3 PLYWOOD GRADE AND THICKNESS FOR WOOD FOUNDATION CONSTRUCTION. Delete this
table in its entirety.

R404.2.4 Backfilling. Delete this section in its entirety.
R404.2.5 Drainage and dampproofing. Delete this section in its entirety.

Created: 2022-11-28 ©9:11:44 [EST]
(Supp. No. 139)

Page 23 of 48



R404.2.6 Fastening. Delete this section in its entirety.
R404.3 Wood sill plates. Amend by adding the following new wording at the end of the section:
"Shims shall be of a non-compressible material and may fill no more than a 1/2 inch gap."
R405.1. Concrete or masonry foundations. Amend by adding the following new section 405.1.2:
"R405.1.2 Footing drain tile.

1. Required outside of basement and crawl space footings. Inside locations are permitted only upon
approval of the Building Official. Minimum diameter shall be four inches (4").

2. Provide drains in all below grade stair landings and window wells. Connect drains to footing drain tile
with approved "T" fittings.

3. Connect with tight-joint glazed tile or approved equal to storm sewer, sump pump, dry well or other
approved outlet.

4. Sump pumps must discharge a minimum of three feet (3') from the foundation walls. Discharge must
conform to the approved grading plan and in no case shall be extended closer than three feet (3') from
the rear or side property line. Sump pumps may not discharge to the front yard or exterior side yard
unless specifically approved by the Building Official."

R405.2 Wood foundations. Delete this section in its entirety.
R405.2.1 Base. Delete this section in its entirety.
R405.2.2 Vapor retarder. Delete this section in its entirety.
R405.2.3 Drainage system. Delete this section in its entirety.
R406.3 Dampproofing for wood foundations. Delete this section in its entirety.
R406.3.1 Panel joint sealed. Delete this section in its entirety.
R406.3.2 Below grade moisture barrier. Delete this section in its entirety.
R406.3.3 Porous fill. Delete this section in its entirety.
R406.3.4 Backfill. Delete this section in its entirety.
R408 Under floor space. Amend by adding the following new Section 468-7: 408.9:

“R408-8: “R408.9: Crawl spaces. In crawl spaces, the soil shall be leveled and covered with a minimum
of two-inch (2") of concrete. Crawl spaces shall be ground level at least twenty-four inches (24") below
bottom of floor joists and girders. Ground under dwelling is to be approximately level."

R502.4 Joists under bearing partitions. Amend by adding the following new Sections 502.4.1 and 502.4.2:

"R502.4.1. Joists under non-bearing partitions. Provide double joists under all parallel partitions.
Double joists, which are separated to permit the installation of piping or vents, shall be blocked, spaced
not more than 4 feet on center.

R502.4.2. Other double joists. Provide double joists supporting hot water heaters, washing machines,
bathtubs or other special loading conditions as determined by the Building-Bfficiat Chief Building
Official."

SECTION 504 PRESSURE PRESERVATIVELY TREATED-WOOD FLOORS (ON GROUND). Delete this section in its
entirety.

R507.8 Deck posts. Delete this section in its entirety and insert the following new section R507.8:

Created: 2022-11-28 09:11:44 [EST]
(Supp. No. 139)

Page 24 of 48



"R407.4 Deck posts. Wooden post support for porches and decks with finished floor constructed six
feet (6') or more above grade shall be no less than six inch by six-inch (6" x 6") nominal lumber. All
lumber used for the exterior construction of porches, terraces and decks shall be naturally durable
wood or pressure treated wood."

SECTION R702.1 General. Amend this section by adding the following new section R702.1.1:

"R702.1.1 Where required. Walls and ceilings for bedrooms on any floor level shall have a minimum
one half inch (%:") layer of gypsum board, or equivalent, taped and finished so as to provide a
continuous surface without breaks or gaps."

R801.3 Roof drainage. Delete in its entirety and add the following new Section 801.3.1.

"R801.3.1 Roof drainage. All structures over one hundred fifty (150) square feet in area shall be
provided with gutters and downspouts unless otherwise waived by the Building-Official Chief Building
Official. Gutters and downspouts must discharge a minimum of five feet (5') away from the building in
accordance with the approved grading plans or to an approved drainage system."

SECTION R1004 FACTORY-BUILT FIREPLACES. Amend by adding the following new Section 1004.6:

"R1004.6 Fireplace chimney enclosures. All exposed exterior chimney sections shall be enclosed in a
chimney chase which provides for proper clearances per manufacturers requirements and is
constructed of masonry or approved materials consistent with the construction of the existing
structure."

M1601.1.1 Above-ground duct systems. Amend by adding the following new text:

=8- “8. Flexible metallic air ducts may be used where practical difficulties are encountered subject to
review and approval by the Building-Official Chief Building Official prior to installation. The maximum
length permitted shall not exceed fourteen feet (14')."

Part Vil-Plumbing. Delete plumbing Chapters 26 through 33, inclusive, in their entirety.

E3406.3 Minimum size of conductors. Delete the first sentence in its entirety and in lieu thereof substitute the
following language:

"The minimum size of conductors for feeders and branch circuits shall be No. 14 copper. All conductors
used for feeders and branch circuits must be copper."

E3602.1 Ampacity of ungrounded conductors. Delete in its entirety and in lieu thereof substitute the following new
Section 3602.1:

"E£3602.1 Minimum size of residential service: Ungrounded service conductors shall have an ampacity of
not less than the load served. For one-family dwellings, the rating of the ungrounded conductors shall
be as follows:

- 100 amp, 20 circuit panel, for dwellings under 2,300 square feet.
No. 3 AWG, copper, minimum conductor size.

- 200 amp, 30 circuit panel, for dwellings over 2,300 square feet.
No. 3/0 AWG, copper, minimum conductor size.

Square footage of dwellings is based on living space, excluding basements and garages. In all cases, the
service must be sized to accommodate the installation of central air conditioning. When an electric
range is installed, the service must be no less than two hundred (200) amp."

SECTION E3703 REQUIRED BRANCH CIRCUITS. Amend by adding the following new section £3783-% E3703.8:

Created: 2022-11-28 09:11:44 [EST]
(Supp. No. 139)

Page 25 of 48



“E3703.7 “€3703.8 Branch circuits for additional equipment. The following additional separate branch
circuits shall be required as needed:

1. Central air conditioning system.
2. Electric range.

a. Free standing ranges, two number 6 and one number 8 minimum size copper
conductors.

b. Built-in counter top and oven units. Connection shall be made by three number 10
(minimum) copper conductors.

3. Built-in microwave oven.

4. Through wall air conditioners and heating units.

5. Motors of 2 horsepower or larger.

6. Electric water heaters.

7. Electric dryers - 240 volt, minimum number 10 wire with "L" shaped receptacle.
8. Sump pump.

9. Sanitary ejector pump.

10. Central vacuum system."

SECTION E3802 ABOVE-GROUND INSTALLATION REQUIREMENTS. Delete in its entirety and in lieu thereof
substitute the following new section E3802:

"SECTION E3802 ABOVE-GROUND INSTALLATION REQUIREMENTS.

E3802.1 New construction. For all new construction, wiring shall be installed in rigid metallic tubing.
Surface metal raceways may be used for lighting purposes only. Where flexible connections other than
lighting are necessary, a separate ground wire shall be pulled in all flexible conduits. Armored cable
such as BX shall not be used in new construction, including garage and/or other accessory buildings. All
raceway joints shall be made tight and shall provide a continuous electrical circuit for grounding
purposes."”

E3905.3 Nonmetallic boxes. Delete this section in its entirety.

E3908.16 Nonmetallic boxes. Delete this section in its entirety.
(Ord. No. 04-0-0100, § 1(Exh. A), 12-6-2004; Ord. No. 2011-0-0047, § 1, 10-3-2011; Ord. No. 15-0-0017, § 3(Exh.
A), 7-6-2015)

Editor's note(s)—Ord. No. 15-0-0017, § 3(Exh. A), adopted July 6, 2015, shall be in full force and effect on Aug. 1,
2015.

Sec. 4-4. Plumbing code.

(a) Adopted. There is hereby adopted by reference as if fully set out herein that certain code known as the
"lllinois Plumbing Code 2014," as published by the Illinois Department of Public Health, copies of which have
been on file for a period of more than thirty (30) days prior to the adoption of this section and are now on
file in the office of the eity-elerk: City Administrator or designee.

(b) Fees.

Created: 2022-11-28 09:11:44 [EST]
(Supp. No. 139)

Page 26 of 48



(1) A permit shall not be issued until the fees prescribed below have been paid, nor shall an amendment to
a permit be released until the additional fee, if any, has been paid.

(2) Schedule of permit fees. A fee for each permit shall be paid as required, in accordance with the
schedule as established Appendix G.

(3) Work commencing before permit issuance. Any person who commences any work before obtaining the
necessary permits shall be subject to an additional fee which shall be in addition to the required permit
fees.

(4) Related fees. The payment of the fee for the construction, alteration, removal or demolition of work
done in connection to or concurrently with the work or activity authorized by a permit shall not relieve
the applicant or holder of the permit from the payment of other fees that are prescribed by law.

(Ord. No. 04-0-0100, § 1(Exh. A), 12-6-2004; Ord. No. 11-0-0031, § 1, 8-1-2011; Ord. No. 15-0-0017, § 3(Exh. A), 7-
6-2015)

Editor's note(s)—Ord. No. 15-0-0017, § 3(Exh. A), adopted July 6, 2015, shall be in full force and effect on Aug. 1,
2015.

Sec. 4-5. Electrical code.

(a) Adopted. There is hereby adopted by reference as if fully set out herein that certain code known as the
“Natienal-Electric Code2014-Edition,~ “National Electrical Code 2020 Edition,” as published by the National
Fire Protection Association, together with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes hereinafter set
forth, one (1) copy of which has been on file for a period of more than thirty (30) days prior to the adoption
of this section and is now on file in the office of the eity-€lerk City Administrator or designee.

(b) Amendments. The following additions, insertions, deletions and changes are hereby made to the above-
adopted code:

210.6(C) 277 Volts to Ground. Amend by adding the following new wording at the end of the article:
27 “(9) Light fixtures shall be mounted no less than eight feet (8') above finished floor.

“(8) “(10) Wall switching shall not exceed 150 volts to ground. Wall switching for circuits exceeding 150
volts to ground shall be installed in one of the following methods:

a. Low voltage relay switches.
b. Panelboard switches."
210.8(A) Dwelling Units. Modify this article by deleting the first paragraph and adding the following new wording:

"210.8(A) Dwelling Units. All 125-volt, single phase, 15- and 20-ampre receptacles installed in the
locations specified in 210.9(A)(1) through (12) shall have ground-fault circuit-interrupter protection for
personnel

210.8(A) Dwelling Units. Modify this article by adding the following wording at the end of the article:

"(11) All light fixtures above bathtub or in shower must be installed with Ground Fault Circuit
Interrupter protection and approved for this type of installation.

(12) Ground Fault Circuit Interrupter outlets shall be resettable at each individual outlet.

Exception: A single GFCI may reset more than one (1) outlet if all affected outlets are located in
the same room."

210.11(C) Dwelling Units. Amend by adding the following new article 210.11(C)}{4}: (5):

Created: 2022-11-28 ©9:11:44 [EST]
(Supp. No. 139)

Page 27 of 48



"210.11(C){4} (5) Other Required Branch Circuits. In addition to those branch circuits required above,
separate branch circuits shall be provided as required below:

1. Furnace or heating plant.
2. Central air conditioning system.
3. Electric range.

a. Free standing ranges, two number 6 and one number 8 minimum size copper
conductors.

b. Built-in counter top and oven units. Connection shall be made by three number 10
(minimum) copper conductors.

4. Built-in microwave oven.
5. Through-wall air conditioners and heating units.
6. Motors of 2 horsepower or larger.
7. Electric water heaters.
8. Electric dryers - 240 volt, minimum number 10 wire with "L" shaped receptacle.
9. Sump pump.

10. Sanitary ejector pump.

11. Central vacuum system."
210.21(B) Receptacles. Amend by adding the following new article 210.21(B)(5):

"210.21(B)(5) Only 20 amp receptacles shall be used on 20 amp circuits supplying cord connected
disposals and dishwashers in residential kitchens."

ARTICLE 210 Branch Circuits. Amend by adding the following new article 210.51:

"210.51 Commercial Office/Business Space Outlets. Receptacle location for offices and similar areas
shall be the same as specified in Article 210.52(A), except that the wall area behind a fully opened door
shall not be included in the measurement. Lobbies shall be required to have only one (1) receptacle
when the area is fifty (50) square feet or less."

230.2 Number of Services. Amend by adding the following sentence at the end of the paragraph:

"In all cases, single family residential properties shall be permitted only one (1) service for all structures
located thereon."

230.42 Minimum Size and Rating. Modify by adding the following wording at the end of the article:

"(D) Minimum size of residential service. The minimum size for residential services shall be as specified
below:

1. 100 amp, 20 circuit panel, for dwellings under 2,300 square feet. Minimum conductor size, #3 AWG.
2. 200 amp, 30 circuit panel, for dwellings over 2,300 square feet. Minimum conductor size #3/0 AWG.

(Square footage of dwellings is based on living space, excluding basements and garages.) In all cases,
the service must be sized to accommodate the installation of central air conditioning. When an electric
range is installed, the service must be no less than 200 amp."

230.70 General. Amend by adding the following new language at the end of the article:

Created: 2022-11-28 ©9:11:44 [EST]
(Supp. No. 139)

Page 28 of 48



"(D) Inside of Building. Where the disconnecting means is installed within a building and where the
raceway of a service entrance is not covered by a suitable fireproofing material (such as two inch (2")
concrete covering), the disconnecting means and/or service panel shall be located within five feet (5')
of the point where such conduit enters the building."

ARTICLE 250 Grounding. Amend by adding the following new article 250.123:

"250.123 Exterior Light Poles. Each new parking lot, drive lane, and street lighting pole shall be
grounded by a separate grounding rod as well as an approved grounding conductor which shall
originate in the electrical panelboard that supplies the power for the lighting pole. The grounding rods
shall be a minimum of eight feet (8') in length and five-eighths inch (5/8") in diameter. All fixtures must
be able to be serviced without dismantling the fixture hanging equipment."

ARTICLE 300 Wiring Methods. Amend by adding the following new article 300.1(D):

"300.1(D) Where any wiring method or materials otherwise permitted by this code shall have been
prohibited by this Article, such wiring methods or materials shall be considered to be prohibited when
referred to in any other section or provision of this code."

300.4 Protection Against Physical Damage. Amend by adding the following new article 300.4(1):

"300.4 (1) Low Voltage Circuits: All wiring for circuits under fifty (50) volts in non-accessible areas, or,
accessible areas less than 8 feet above the finish floor shall be installed in electrical metallic tubing.
Wiring may be run exposed in accessible areas such as, but not limited to, spaces above dropped
ceilings, attic spaces, crawl spaces provided it has been properly fastened."

(c) General provisions.

(1) An electrical service inspection will be approved only after the service panel is adequately protected
from the weather. This shall typically be provided by the installation of the decking of the floor above
the service panel.

(2) Rough electrical inspection shall be approved only after all piping is completed and wires have been
pulled unless otherwise approved in advance.

(3) Forall new work, wiring shall be installed in rigid metallic tubing, or surface metal raceways.
Underground wiring for commercial and industrial work will be in heavy wall conduit, IMC conduit or
PVC Schedule 40 for exterior installations. Other wiring installations and/or methods for specialized
non-residential building applications may be approved by the building official when requested in
writing, when showing cause as to why such installation or method is necessary, and, when consistent
with approved industry standards and practices.

(4) All raceway joints shall be made tight and shall provide a continuous electrical circuit for grounding
purposes.

(d) Fees.

(1) A permit shall not be issued until the fees prescribed below have been paid, nor shall an amendment to
a permit be released until the additional fee, if any, has been paid.

(2) Schedule of permit fees. A fee for each permit shall be paid as required, in accordance with the
schedule as established by the applicable governing authority.

(3) Work commencing before permit issuance. Any person who commences any work before obtaining the
necessary permits shall be subject to an additional fee established by the code official, which shall be in
addition to the required permit fees.

Created: 2022-11-28 09:11:44 [EST]
(Supp. No. 139)

Page 29 of 48



(4) Related fees. The payment of the fee for the construction, alteration, removal or demolition of work
done in connection to or concurrently with the work or activity authorized by a permit shall not relieve
the applicant or holder of the permit from the payment of other fees that are prescribed by law.

(5) Refunds. The code-official Chief Building Official is authorized to establish a refund policy.

(Ord. No. 04-0-0100, § 1(Exh. A), 12-6-2004; Ord. No. 11-0-0031, § 1, 8-1-2011; Ord. No. 15-0-0017, § 3(Exh. A), 7-
6-2015)

Editor's note(s)—Ord. No. 15-0-0017, § 3(Exh. A), adopted July 6, 2015, shall be in full force and effect on Aug. 1,
2015.

Sec. 4-6. Mechanical code.

(a) Adopted. There is hereby adopted by reference as if fully set out herein that certain code known as the "2015
International Mechanical Code," including Appendix A, as published by the International Code Council,
together with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes hereinafter set forth, one (1) copy of which
has been on file for a period of more than thirty (30) days prior to the adoption of this section and is now on
file in the office of the eity-elerk City Administrator or designee.

(b) Amendments. The following additions, insertions, deletions and changes are hereby made to the above-
adopted code:

[A] 101.1 Title. Insert "City of West Chicago" where indicated.

[A] 1684 115.4 Violation penalties. Delete this section in its entirety and substitute the following new Section
1084 115.4.

"[A] Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code, fail to comply with any of
the requirements thereof or erect, install, alter or repair work in violation of the approved construction
documents or directive of the eede-efficial Chief Building Official, or of a permit or certificate issued
under the provisions of this code, shall be subject to penalties as provided in Chapter 1, section 1-8 of
the Code of Ordinances of the City of West Chicago".

[A] 1085 116 Stop work orders. Delete this section in its entirety and substitute the following new Section 308:5
141575

Created: 2022-11-28 ©09:11:44 [EST]
(Supp. No. 139)

Page 30 of 48



“[A] 288-5 117 Stop work orders. Upon notice from the code-official Chief Building Official that work is
being done contrary to the provisions of this code or in a dangerous or unsafe manner, such work shall
immediately cease. Such notice shall be in writing and shall be given to the owner of the property, the
owner's agent, or the person doing the work. The notice shall state the conditions under which work is
authorized to resume. Where an emergency exists, the eede-efficial Chief Building Official shall not be
required to give a written notice prior to stopping the work. Any person who shall continue any work
on the system after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is
directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject to penalties as provided
in Chapter 1, section 1-8 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of West Chicago".

SECTION 109 113 MEANS OF APPEAL. Delete this section in its entirety and substitute the following new
section 389 118:

"SECTION 109
MEANS OF APPEAL

[A] #89-1 118.1 General. In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or determinations
made by the building-efficial Chief Building official relative to the application and interpretation of this
code, there shall be and is hereby created a board of appeals. The board of appeals shall be appointed
by the applicable governing authority and shall hold office at its pleasure. The board shall adopt rules
of procedure for conducting its business.

[A] #09-2 118.2 Limitations on authority. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that the
true intent of this code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been incorrectly interpreted, the
provisions of this code do not fully apply or an equally good or better form of construction is proposed.
The board shall have no authority to waive requirements of this code.

[A] 893 118.3 Qualifications. The board of appeals shall consist of members who are qualified by
experience and training to pass on matters pertaining to building construction and are not employees
of the jurisdiction."

(Ord. No. 04-0-0100, § 1(Exh. A), 12-6-2004; Ord. No. 11-0-0031, § 1, 8-1-2011; Ord. No. 15-0-0017, § 3(Exh. A), 7-
6-2015)

Editor's note(s)—Ord. No. 15-0-0017, & 3(Exh. A), adopted July 6, 2015, shall be in full force and effect on Aug. 1,
2015.

Sec. 4-7. Fuel gas code.

(a) Adopted. There is hereby adopted by reference, as if fully set out herein, that certain code known as the
2015 International-Fuel-Gas-Code 2021 International Fuel Gas Code," including Appendix Chapters A—D
inclusive, as prepared and published by the International Code Council, Inc., together with the additions,
insertions, deletions and changes hereinafter set forth, one (1) copy of which has been [on file] for a period
of more than thirty (30) days prior to the effective date hereof and now is on file in the office of the city
clerk.

(b) Amendments. The following additions, insertions, deletions and changes are hereby made to the
International Fuel Gas Code:

101.1 Title. Insert "City of West Chicago" where indicated.

186-6- 109 Fees. Delete this section and all subsections in its entirety and insert the following sections 106-6 109
thru 106-6-4 109.4:

Created: 2022-11-28 ©9:11:44 [EST]
(Supp. No. 139)

Page 31 0f 48



"106.6 109 Fees. A permit shall not be issued until the fees prescribed in Section 306-6-% 109.1 have been paid, nor
shall an amendment to a permit be released until the additional fee, if any, has been paid.

106-6-1 109.1 Schedule of permit fees. A fee for each permit shall be paid as required, in
accordance with the schedule as established by the applicable governing authority.

106-6-2 109.2 Work commencing before permit issuance. Any person who commences any work
before obtaining the necessary permits shall be subject to an additional fee established by the
code official, which shall be in addition to the required permit fees.

106-6-3 109.3 Related fees. The payment of the fee for the construction, alteration, removal or
demolition of work done in connection to or concurrently with the work or activity authoriz<ns1:XMLFault xmlns:ns1="http://cxf.apache.org/bindings/xformat"><ns1:faultstring xmlns:ns1="http://cxf.apache.org/bindings/xformat">java.lang.OutOfMemoryError: Java heap space</ns1:faultstring></ns1:XMLFault>